

BID DUE: APRIL 9, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

			Proforce Law Enforcement Prescott, AZ			G T Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX			Clyde Armory Athens, GA		
Item	Description	Qty	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total
1	Communications Gear - Peltor ComTac VI single comm with NIB tech removable head band with gel cush arc adpt coyote (MT20H682FB47NCY)	20			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID
2	Filters for masks - Avon Protection CTCF50 Filter (72606/3) 4-pack	25			NO BID	Avon 72606-3	\$143.11	\$3,578	Avon 76606-3 (4 pack)	\$146.83	\$3,671
3	Breaching Tools - BlackHawk Tactical Entry Kit #3 (DE-EK3)	2	BlackHawk DE-Ek3	\$1,213.77	\$2,428	BlackHawk DE-EK3	\$1,189.65	\$2,379	BlackHawk DE-EK3	\$1,262.60	\$2,525
4	Helmet Lights - SureFire LED Helmet Light, 3 white lights, 2 red lights, 1 infrared (HL1-C-TN)	20	SureFire HL1-C-TN	\$131	\$2,610	SureFire HL1-C-TN	\$128.59	\$2,572	SureFire HL1-C-TN	\$141.24	\$2,825
5	Spotting Scopes - Diamond Back 20-60x60 angled spotting scope (DBK-60A1)	6			NO BID	Vortex DBK-60A1	\$285.95	\$1,716	Vortex DBK-60A1	\$292.71	\$1,756
6	12.5 ft Kadell aluminum telescoping ladder, non-slip, multipurpose extension ladder with foot pad, 330lbs capacity	4			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID
7	Laser Range Finder - Ranger 1300 Laser Rangefinder (RRF-131)	8			NO BID	Vortex Ranger 1800 RRF-181	\$279.30	\$2,234	Vortex RRF-181	\$286.81	\$2,294

BID DUE: APRIL 9, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

			Proforce Law Enforcement Prescott, AZ			G T Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX			Clyde Armory Athens, GA		
Item	Description	Qty	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total
8	Vortex Diamond Bck 10x42 (DB-205)	8			NO BID	Vortex Diamondback HD DB-215	\$153.18	\$1,225	Vortex DB-215	\$157.21	\$1,258
9	Rifle Shield - Paraclete ASPIS-X Gen II Level III rifle shield with viewport and light, size 21x36 (SH3PTFXMV1H5L2)	1			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID
10	Saw - Partner K-12 FD Rescue Saw (FHU-K12FD)	1			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID
11	Sniper Drag Bag - Eberlestock rifle dry bag and crown shield, military green (A4DBMJ)	8			NO BID			NO BID	Eberlestock A4DBMJ	\$127.57	\$1,021
Total Bid					\$5,038			\$13,704			\$15,350
Delivery Days					90			30-45			30-90

BID DUE: APRIL 9, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

			Smyrna Police Distributors Smyrna, GA				Dana Safety Supply Tampa, FL				SRT Supply Jacksonville, FL
Item	Description	Qty	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total
1	Communications Gear - Peltor ComTac VI single comm with NIB tech removable head band with gel cush arc adpt coyote (MT20H682FB47NCY)	20			NO BID	Peltor MT20H682FB4 7NCY	\$838.58	\$16,772	MT20H682FB4 7NCY	\$680.00	\$13,600
2	Filters for masks - Avon Protection CTCF50 Filter (72606/3) 4-pack	25			NO BID	Avon CTCF50 Filter 4 pack	\$156.00	\$3,900	72606/3	\$140.00	\$3,500
3	Breaching Tools - BlackHawk Tactical Entry Kit #3 (DE-EK3)	2	DE-EK3	\$1,290	\$2,580	BlackHawk DE-EK3	\$1,384.99	\$2,770	DE-EK3	\$1,050.00	\$2,100
4	Helmet Lights - SureFire LED Helmet Light, 3 white lights, 2 red lights, 1 infrared (HL1-C-TN)	20	HL1-C-TN	\$142	\$2,840	SureFire HL1-C-TN	\$148.88	\$2,978	HL1-C-TN	\$139.00	\$2,780
5	Spotting Scopes - Diamond Back 20-60x60 angled spotting scope (DBK-60A1)	6	DBK-60A1	\$300	\$1,800			NO BID	DBK-60A1	\$330.00	\$1,980
6	12.5 ft Kadell aluminum telescoping ladder, non-slip, multipurpose extension ladder with foot pad, 330lbs capacity	4	Safariland Protech 1174080 Portol 12' Folding Ladder	\$1,900	\$7,600			NO BID			NO BID
7	Laser Range Finder - Ranger 1300 Laser Rangefinder (RRF-131)	8	RRF-131	\$296	\$2,368			NO BID	RRF-181	\$322.00	\$2,576
8	Vortex Diamond Bck 10x42 (DB-205)	8	DB-205	\$163	\$1,304			NO BID	DB-215	\$177.00	\$1,416

BID DUE: APRIL 9, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

		Smyrna Police Distributors Smyrna, GA				Dana Safety Supply Tampa, FL			SRT Supply Jacksonville, FL		
Item	Description	Qty	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total
9	Rifle Shield - Paraclete ASPIS-X Gen II Level III rifle shield with viewport and light, size 21x36 (SH3PTFXMV1H5L2)	1			NO BID	Paraclete SH3PTFXMV1H5L2	\$8,720.93	\$8,721	VP & Led Light SH30ASLXV1H1L1	\$7,922.00	\$7,922
10	Saw - Partner K-12 FD Rescue Saw (FHU-K12FD)	1			NO BID			NO BID			NO BID
11	Sniper Drag Bag - Eberlestock rifle dry bag and crown shield, military green (A4DBMJ)	8			NO BID	Elberstock A4DBMJ	\$129.20	\$1,034	A4DBMJ	\$112.00	\$896
Total Bid					\$18,492			\$36,174			\$36,770
Delivery Days					30			30-60			

BID DUE: APRIL 9, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

**INV Tech
Services, LLC
Roswell, GA**

Item	Description	Qty	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total
1	Communications Gear - Peltor ComTac VI single comm with NIB tech removable head band with gel cush arc adpt coyote (MT20H682FB47NCY)	20	MT20H682FB47 N-CY	\$777.60	\$15,552
2	Filters for masks - Avon Protection CTCF50 Filter (72606/3) 4-pack	25	72606/3	\$193.36	\$4,834
3	Breaching Tools - BlackHawk Tactical Entry Kit #3 (DE-EK3)	2	DE-EK3	\$1,412.40	\$2,825
4	Helmet Lights - SureFire LED Helmet Light, 3 white lights, 2 red lights, 1 infrared (HL1-C-TN)	20	HL1-C-TN	\$139.20	\$2,784
5	Spotting Scopes - Diamond Back 20-60x60 angled spotting scope (DBK-60A1)	6	DBK-60A1	\$347.21	\$2,083
6	12.5 ft Kadell aluminum telescoping ladder, non-slip, multipurpose extension ladder with foot pad, 330lbs capacity	4	KADELL 12.5FT	\$112.84	\$451

BID DUE: APRIL 9, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

**INV Tech
Services, LLC**
Roswell, GA

Item	Description	Qty	Mfg. & Item #	Unit Price	Total
7	Laser Range Finder - Ranger 1300 Laser Rangefinder (RRF-131)	8	RRF-181	\$339.21	\$2,714
8	Vortex Diamond Bck 10x42 (DB-205)	8	DB-215	189.34	1514.72
9	Rifle Shield - Paraclete ASPIS-X Gen II Level III rifle shield with viewport and light, size 21x36 (SH3PTFXMV1H5L2)	1	SH3OASLLXV1H 1L	\$9,420.00	\$9,420
10	Saw - Partner K-12 FD Rescue Saw (FHU-K12FD)	1	FHU-K12- FD12x24	\$1,650.00	\$1,650
11	Sniper Drag Bag - Eberlestock rifle dry bag and crown shield, military green (A4DBMJ)	8	A4DBMJ	\$171.72	\$1,374
Total Bid					\$45,202
Delivery Days					OOB 60**