

RFQ 18-0060-3 ANNUAL PRICING FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

RFQ DUE: June 20, 2018 @ 2:00 P.M.

	Valent BioSciences, LLC Libertyville, IL	Univar Chamblee, GA	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL
<b>ADULTICIDES</b> (Indicate trade name and AI%)				
Sumethrin 10+10 -30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6,767.01/drum
Sumethrin (dual- action) – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5 gal: \$1,079.65/case 30 gal: \$6,360.00/30 gal case 275 gal tote: \$54,771.75/tote
Permethrin – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote	No Bid	<b>Kontrol 30-30</b> 2x2.5 gal jg/cs: \$125.15/jg 30 gal drum: \$53/gal 275 gal poly tank: \$51.61/gal <b>Kontrol 31-67</b> 2x2.5 gal jg/cs: \$220.73/jg 30 gal drum: \$88.14/gal	<b>PCT 3-15 ULV</b> 2x2.5 gal/case: \$215/case 55 gal drum: \$2,365.00/drum 275 gal tote: \$11,825.00/tote <b>Aquareslin 20-20:</b> 30 gal drum - \$3,600/drum <b>Permanone (RTU):</b> 30 gal drum: \$845.40/drum <b>Permanone 31-66:</b> 4 gal case:\$440.00/case 30 gal drum:\$3,300/case 275 gal tote: \$30,250/case <b>Permanone 30-30:</b> 30 gal drum: \$2,666.40/drum 275 gal tote:\$24,200/drum	<b>Biomist 3+15</b> 5 gal/case: \$395.51/case 30 gal/case: \$2,116.80/case Tote: \$16,354.80
Chlorpyrifos – 30/55 30 gal drum, 50 gal drum & tote	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30 gal drum: \$1,940.40/drum 50 gal drum: \$ 3,447.40/drum Tote:\$16,071.00/tote
Malathion – tote (specify size)	No Bid	<b>Fyfanon:</b> 260 gal tote: \$14,012.00	<b>Fyfanon:</b> 5 gal pail:\$295.00 260 gal tote: \$14,012.00/tote 55 gal drum: \$3,142.00/drum Bulk: \$50.00/gal	No Bid
Resmethrin – 4+12 – 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Scourge 4-12</b> 275 gal tote: \$33,530.75/tote	No Bid
Naled EC formulation – 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Trumpet</b> 30 gal drum: \$6,328.04/drum <b>Dibrom:</b> 30 gal drum \$6,744.30/drum	No Bid

	<b>Valent BioSciences, LLC Libertyville, IL</b>	<b>Univar Chamblee, GA</b>	<b>Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL</b>	<b>Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL</b>
<b>Etofenprox</b> – 30 gal drum	No Bid	<b>Zenivex</b> \$2,496.00/drum	<b>Zenivex E20</b> 30 gal drum: \$9,084.00 <b>Zenivex E4</b> 30 gal drum: \$2,496.60/drum <b>Aqua Zenivex E20</b> 30 gal drum: \$9,084.00/drum	No Bid
<b>Deltamethrin</b> (Specify container size – include SDS/label)	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Deltagard ULV</b> 2x2.25 gal/case: \$1,017.66 30 gal drum: \$5,908.14/drum 250 gal tote: \$48,683.63/tote	No Bid
<b>Dichlorvos</b> – strips (specify quantity)	No Bid	<b>Nuvant</b> 3x6.5gm pk: \$30.00/pk (36 pks/cs)	<b>Nuvan Prostrips</b> 72#carton:\$279.52/carton 432#case:\$1,677.10/case 18#carton:\$201.61/carton 108#case:\$1,209.64/case	No Bid
<b>Barrier Product</b> (specify container size – include SDS/label)	No Bid	<b>Talstar Pro:</b> 4 x1 gal/case: \$48.94/g <b>Suspend SC:</b> 16x1pt: \$35.23/pt 4x1gal: \$259.88/g <b>Demand CS:</b> 8x8oz: \$35.29/bt 8x32oz: \$116.15/bt <b>Cykick CS:</b> 4x120oz jug: \$205.00/jg 6x16oz: \$35.50/bt <b>Mavrik Perimeter:</b> 12x8oz bt:\$29.41/bt <b>Masterline Bifen:</b> 1gal: \$33.00/bt	<b>Wisdom TC Flowable:</b> 4x1 gal case - \$665.00 <b>Suspend Polyzone:</b> 16x1 pint case - \$650.00	<b>Flit 10ec</b> 55 gal drum: \$6,310.48
<b>LARVICIDES</b>				
<b>Altosid XR Briquettes</b> – 220 case	No Bid	\$734.80/case	\$734.80/case	\$734.80/case
<b>Altosid XR Ignots</b> – 220 case	No Bid	\$734.80/case	\$734.80/case	\$734.80/case
<b>Altosid SR-20</b> – 5 gal case	No Bid	\$4,590.00/case	2x2.5 gal/case: \$4,590/case	\$4,590/case
<b>Altosid Pellets</b> – 44# case	No Bid	\$1,124.20/case	\$1,124.20/case	\$1,124.20/case
<b>Altosid XR-G</b> – 40# bag & 1,000# supersack	No Bid	\$350.00/40# bag \$8,650.00/ 1000# bag	40#bag: \$350.00 1000#bag: \$8,650.00	40#bag: \$350.00/bag 1000# sac:\$8,650.00/bag

	<b>Valent BioSciences, LLC</b> Libertyville, IL	<b>Univar</b> Chamblee, GA	<b>Adapco, LLC</b> Sanford, FL	<b>Clarke Mosquito Control</b> St. Charles, IL
<b>Altosid SBG</b> – 40# bag & 1,000# supersack	No Bid	40# bag : \$125.60 1000# bag: \$3,140.00	40#bag: \$125.60 1000# bag:\$3,140.00	40#bag: \$125.60/bag 1000# bag: \$3,140.00/bag
<b>Altosid WSP</b> – 800 case	No Bid	50x16cs (40cs on a pallet) \$672.00/case	\$672.00/case	\$672.00/case
<b>Altosid PRO-G</b> - Case	No Bid	\$126.48/case	24x10 oz/case: \$126.48/case	No Bid
<b>Altosid DUPLEX-G</b> – 40# bag & 1,000# supersack	No Bid	40# bag: \$570.00 2#K tote: \$13,900.00/1k#	40#bag: \$570.00 2K# bag: \$27,800	No Bid
<b>Monomolecular Larviciding film</b> – 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Non-separating/settling Larviciding oil</b> – 55 gal drum	No Bid	50gal: \$450.00/drum	<b>BVA2:</b> \$565.96/drum <b>Sunspray MLO:</b> \$467.50/drum	<b>CocoBear:</b> \$1,021.35/drum
<b>Bti</b> (all available particle sizes) – 40# bag, 1200# bag, 1600# bag	No Bid	40# bag: \$80.00/bag 1200# bag: \$2,400/bag 1600# bag supersack: \$3,200/bag	<b>Aquabac 200G:</b> 40#bag: \$75.20 <b>Aquabac 400G:</b> 40#bag: \$180.40 <b>Aquabac 200G:</b> 1000#bag: \$2,160	40# bag: \$74.00/bag 1200# bag: \$2,160.00/bag 1600# bag: No Bid
<b>Bti/methoprene granular mixture</b> (specify container size – include SDS/label)	Vecto Prime FG 40#bag: \$158.00		<b>Fourstar – 45</b> 200 per case: \$264.04/case <b>Fourstar – 90</b> 200 per case: \$441.80/case <b>Fourstar – 180</b> 200 per case: \$692.79/case <b>Fourstar BTI – 45</b> 200 per case: \$264.04/case <b>Fourstar BTI – 150</b> 200 per case: \$690.15/case <b>Fourstar BTI CRG</b> 35# bag: \$407.72/bag <b>Fourstar MBG</b> 40#bag: \$335.30/bag	
<b>Bacillus Sphaericus WSP</b> – 800 case	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Spheratax WSP</b> \$698.00/case	\$680.00/case

	Valent BioSciences, LLC Libertyville, IL	Univar Chamblee, GA	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL
<b>Bacillus Sphaericus</b> – (all available particle sizes) – 40# bag	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Spheratax</b> \$240.00/bag	\$232.00/bag
<b>Bacillus Sphaericus</b> & Bti WSP - case (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,160.00/case
<b>Spinosad</b> (all available types) – case/40# bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Natular:</b> G – 40#bag: \$239.51/bag T30 – 400case: \$612.45/case G30 – 40#bag: \$627.38/bag XRT – 220case: \$645.93/case 2EC – 2x2.5gal case: \$5,200.03/case DT – 50 card tablets: \$307.20/12 tabs DT – 50 card tablets: \$1,157.86/50 tabs
<b>DILUENT OILS</b>				
Diluent Oils (BVA grade 13) - 55 gal drum	No Bid	\$400.00/ max 50 gal drum	BVA13 or Calpar 80 \$445.50/drum	<b>Envirotech 13:</b> \$1,178.57

Procurement Specialist:

