

RFQ DUE: MAY 11, 2017 @ 2:00 P.M.

	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Target Specialty Products Norcross, GA	Univar Chamblee, GA	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL
ADULTICIDES (Indicate brand name and AI%)					
Sumethrin 10+10 -30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,280.13/drum
Sumethrin (dual-action) – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5 gal: \$1,058.50 30 gal: \$6,235.20 275 gal: \$53,696.50
Permethrin – 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	Evoluer 4-4 2.5 gal: \$17.00/g 30 gal: \$17.00/g 55 gal: \$16.00/g 275 gal: \$15.75/g Evoluer 30-30 2.5 gal: \$58.00/g 30 gal: \$58.00/g 55 gal: \$57.74/g 275 gal: \$57.24/g Evoluer 31-66: 2.5 gal: \$94.00/g 30 gal: \$94.00/g 55 gal: \$93.00/g 275 gal: \$93.00/g Envion RTU 2.5 gal: \$17.00/g 30 gal: \$17.00/g 55 gal: \$16.00/g 275 gal: \$15.75/g Envion 2.5 gal: \$130.00/g 30 gal: \$130.00/g 55 gal: \$129.00/g	Perm-X UL 4-4: 5 gal case - \$46.95 Perm-X UL 4-4: 30 gal drum - \$545.00 Perm-X UL 4-4: 55 gal drum - \$978.15 Perm-X UL 4-4: 275 gal tote - \$4,625.00 Perm-X UL 30-30: 5 gal case - \$335.00 Perm-X UL 30-30: 30 gal drum - \$1,640.00 Perm-X UL 30-30: 55 gal drum - \$3,084.00 Perm-X UL 30-30: 275 gal tote – \$14,265.00 Perm-X UL 31-66: 5 gal case - \$486.00 Perm-X UL 31-66: 30 gal drum - \$2,595.00 Perm-X UL 31-66: 55 gal drum - \$4,998.00 Perm-X UL 31-66: 275 gal tote – \$23,992.00 Aqua Perm-X UL 30-30: 5 gal case – \$529.00 Aqua Perm-X UL 30-30: 55 gal drum – \$5,290.00	Kontrol 31-67 5 gal: \$220.73/2.5g 30 gal drum: \$88.14/g Kontrol 30-30 5 gal: \$125.15/2.5g 30 gal: \$53.00/g 275 gal tote: \$51.61/g	Aquareslin 20-20: 30 gal drum - \$5,400 Permanone (RTU): 30 gal drum: \$845.40 Permanone 31-66: 4 gal case:\$440.00 30 gal drum:\$3,300 275 gal tote: \$30,250 Permanone 30-30: 30 gal drum: \$2,666.40 275 gal tote:\$24,200	No Bid

	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Target Specialty Products Norcross, GA	Univar Chamblee, GA	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL
Chlorpyrifos – 30/55 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	MosquitoMist 2 30 gal: \$ 2,121.01 55 gal: \$ 3,811.90 275 gal tote:\$18,913.36
Malathion – tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	Fyfanon: 260 gal tote: \$13,507	Fyfanon: 5 gal pail:\$285.70 260 gal tote: \$13,507.00 55 gal drum: \$3,035.45	No Bid
Resmethrin – 4+12 – 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	30 gal drum: \$6,500.45 275 gal tote: \$32,004.50	No Bid
Naled EC formulation – 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Trumpet 30 gal drum: \$5,796.60 Dibrom conc: 30 gal drum \$6,177.60	No Bid
Etofenprox – 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,472/drum	Zenivex E20 30 gal drum: \$8,994.00 Zenivex E4 (RTU) 30 gal drum \$2,472.00	No Bid
Dichlorvos – strips (specify quantity)	No Bid	Nuvan Prostrips 12x16 gram - \$42.67/pack 3x65gram - \$31.25/pack	No Bid	Nuvan Prostrips 72#carton:\$246.00 432#case:\$1,550.00 18#carton:\$188.00 108#case:\$1,120.00	No Bid
Barrier Product (specify container size – include SDS/label)	No Bid	Bifen I/T: \$31.25/gallon jug Demand CS: \$119.00/quart Suspend SC: \$261.50 Talstr P: \$37.50/0.75 gallon	Talstar Pro: 4 gal/case: \$48.94/g Suspend SC: 16pt: \$35.23/pt 4gal: \$259.88/g Demand CS: 8x8oz: \$35.29/bt 8x32oz: \$116.15/bt Cykick CS: 4x120oz jug: \$205.00/jg 6x16oz: \$35.50/bt Mavrik Perimeter: 12x8oz bt:\$29.41/bt Masterline Bifen: 1gal: \$33.00/bt	Wisdom TC Flowable: 4 gal case - \$665.00 Suspend Polyzone: 16 pint case - \$650.00	Flit 13.3 4 gal/case: \$817.60
LARVICIDES					
Altosid XR Briquettes – 220 case	No Bid	No Bid	\$710.60/case	\$440.00/case	\$710.60/case
Altosid XR Ignots – 220 case	No Bid	No Bid	\$710.60/case	\$710.60/case	\$710.60/case
Altosid SR-20 – 5 gal case	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,500/case	\$4,500/case	\$4,500/case

	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Target Specialty Products Norcross, GA	Univar Chamblee, GA	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL
Altosid Pellets – 44# case	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,124.20/case	\$1,124.20/case	\$1,124.20/case
Altosid XR-G – 40# bag & 1,000# supersack	No Bid	No Bid	\$338.00/40# bag \$8,450.00/ 1000# bag	40#bag: \$338.00 1000#sac: \$8,450.00	40#bag: \$338.00 1000# sac:\$8,450.00
Altosid SBG – 40# bag & 1,000# supersack	No Bid	No Bid	40# bag : \$122.40 1000# bag: \$3,060.00	40#bag: \$122.40 1000# bag:\$3,060.00	40#bag: \$122.40 1000# bag: \$3,060.00
Altosid WSP – 800 case	No Bid	No Bid	\$648.00/case	\$648.00/case	\$648.00/case
Monomolecular Larviciding film – 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Non- separating/settling Larviciding oil – 55 gal drum	No Bid	BVA 2: \$475.00/drum	\$430.00/drum	Sunspray MLO: \$467.50	CocoBear: \$991.65/case
Bti (all available particle sizes) – 40# bag, 1200# bag, 1600# bag	Sustain MBG 10/14 8# - \$56.80 1200# - \$7,920 Sustain MBG 10/14 OR 5/8 40# - \$276.00 1000# - \$6,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	40#bag: \$64.00 1200#bag: \$1,920.00	40# bag: \$82.44 1200# bag: \$2,451.60 1600# bag: \$3,232
Bti/methoprene granular mixture (specify container size – include SDS/label)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bacillus Sphaericus WSP – 800 case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$674.00/case	\$761.30/case
Bacillus Sphaericus – (all available particle sizes) – 40# bag	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$232.00/bag	\$226.56/bag
Bacillus Sphaericus & Bti WSP - case (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,430.00/case

	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Target Specialty Products Norcross, GA	Univar Chamblee, GA	Adapco, LLC Sanford, FL	Clarke Mosquito Control St. Charles, IL
Spinosad (all available types) – case/40# bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	Natular: G – 40#bag: \$216.00 T30 – 400case: \$584.00 G30 – 40#bag: \$608.00 XRT – 220case: \$928.40 2EC – 5gal case: \$5,138.10 DT – 50 card tablets – 2500 case: \$1,121.50
DILUENT OILS					
Diluent Oils (BVA grade 13) - 55 gal drum	No Bid	BVA Spray 13: \$385.00/drum	\$325.92/ 50 gal drum	\$358.05/drum	Envirotech: \$1,157.12

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to be 'John B. B.', is located in the lower right quadrant of the page.