

Mosquito Control Chemicals Recap  
RFQ 15-0044-3  
RFQ DUE: May 19, 2015 @ 2:00PM

ADULTICIDES	Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Univar USA Chamblee, GA
Sumethrin 10 + 10; 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	30 gal drum: \$6,965.43	No Bid
Sumethrin (Dual- action) - 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (Specify size)	No Bid		5 gal: \$1005.74 30 gal: \$5,925.13 275 gal tote: \$51,104.62	No Bid
Permethrin - 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	<p><b>Permanone 10 EC:</b> No Bid</p> <p><b>Permanone (RTU):</b> 30 gal drum: \$28.18/g</p> <p><b>Permanone 3166:</b> 4 gal case:\$149.56/g 30 gal drum:\$118.35/g 275 gal tote: \$109.00/g</p> <p><b>Permanone 3030:</b> 30 gal drum: \$111.90/g 275 gal tote:\$103.42</p>	<p><b>Evoluer 4-4</b> 2.5 gal: \$18.50/g 30 gal: \$18.50/g 55 gal: \$18.00/g 275 gal: \$17.00/g</p> <p><b>Evoluer 30-30</b> 2.5 gal: \$56.88/g 30 gal: \$56.88/g 55 gal: \$56.88/g 275 gal: \$56.00/g</p> <p><b>Evoluer 31-66:</b> 2.5 gal: \$92.54/g 30 gal: \$92.54/g 55 gal: \$92.54/g 275 gal: \$92.54/g</p> <p><b>Envion RTU</b> 2.5 gal: \$17.50/g 30 gal: \$17.50/g 55 gal: \$16.50/g 275 gal: \$16.00/g</p>	5 gal/cs: \$373.73 30g dr \$2,202.57 275g tote \$19,204.44	<p><b>Kontrol 31-67</b> 30 gal drum: \$2,644.20</p> <p><b>Kontrol 30-30</b> 30 gal: \$1,642.50 275 gal tote: \$15,056.25</p>
Chlorpyrifos - 30/55 gal drum & tote(specify size per drum and tote)	55 gal drum: \$2,182.95 250 gal tote: \$8,875.99	No Bid	30 gal: \$ 2,021.41 55 gal: \$ 3,632.60 275 gal tote:\$18,027.86	55 gal drum:\$1,595.00
Malathion - tote (specify size)	260 gal tote: \$11,853.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Resmethrin 4+12 -30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	55 gal drum: \$6,369.55 275 gal tote: \$31,468.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

<b>ADULTICIDES</b>	<b>Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL</b>	<b>AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI</b>	<b>Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL</b>	<b>Univar USA Chamblee, GA</b>
Naled EC formulation; 30 gal drum	<i>Trumpet EC</i> 30 gal drum: \$5,343.30  <i>Dibrom conc:</i> 30 gal drum \$5,694.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Etofenprox; 30 gal drum	<i>Zenivex E20</i> 5 gal case: \$296.00/gal 30 gal drum: \$294.00/g <i>Zenivex E4 (RTU)</i> 5 gal case: \$80.75/gal 30 gal drum \$79.80/gal	No Bid	No Bid	30 gal <i>E4</i> : \$2,394.00 30 gal <i>E20</i> : \$8,820.00
Dichlorvos; strips (specify quantity)	<i>Nuvan Prostrips</i> 72#carton:\$246.01 432#case:\$1,476.09 18#carton:\$177.54 108#case:\$1,065.22	No Bid	No Bid	<i>Nuvan Amvac</i> 3x65gm pk \$25.00 36 pk/case \$900.00
Barrier Product (specify container size – include SDS/label)			Flit 13.3 4x1 gal/case \$809.60	<i>MI Bifen</i> 4x1 gal/case: \$126.00 12x8oz bt per case: \$336.00
<b>LARVICIDES</b>				
Altosid XR Briquets – 220 case	\$697.40	No Bid	\$697.40	\$697.40
Altosid XR Ingots – 220 case	\$697.40	No Bid	\$697.40	\$697.40
Altosid SR-20 - 5 gal case	\$4,460.00	No Bid	\$4,460.00	\$4,460.00
Altosid Pellets - 44#case	\$1,124.20	No Bid	\$1,124.20	\$1,124.20
Altosid XR-G - 40#bag & 1,000 #supersack	40#bag: \$333.20 1000 lb sac: \$8,330.00	No Bid	40#bag: \$333.20 1000 lb sac:\$8,330.00	40#bag: \$333.20
Altosid SBG - 40#bag & 1,000 #supersack	40#bag: \$120.00 1000 lb bag: \$3,000.00	No Bid	40#bag: \$120.00 1000 lb bag: \$3,000.00	40#bag: \$120.00 1000 lb bag: \$8,330.00

<b>LARVICIDES</b>	<b>Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL</b>	<b>AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI</b>	<b>Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL</b>	<b>Univar USA Chamblee, GA</b>
Altosid WSP - 800 case	case: \$648.00	No Bid	case: \$648.00	case: \$648.00
Mono-molecular Larvicide Films; 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Non-separating/ settling laviciding oil; 55 gal drum	<b>BVA 2</b> 50 gal drum: \$437.50 55 gal drum: \$471.35	No Bid	<b>Coco Bear</b> 55 gal drum \$990.79	<b>ML Kontrol Lav. Oil</b> \$440.00
Bti (all available particle size) - 40#bag - 1200#bag - 1600#bag supersack	40#bag: \$64.00 1200#bag: \$1,920.00 1600 #bag: NO BID	Sustain MBG 10/14 8# - \$53.68 Sustain MBG 10/14 OR 5/8 40# - \$248.00 1000# - \$6,150.00	<b>Vectobac GS</b> 40#bag: \$64.80 1200#bag: \$1,908.00 1600#bag: NO BID	No Bid
<i>Bacillus sphaerius</i> WSP - 800 case	<b>Spheratax</b> WSP: \$695.00	No Bid	<b>Vectolex WSP</b> 800 case: \$678.00	No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus - (all available particle sizes) - 40#bag	<b>Spheratax</b> , 40#bag: \$239.60	No Bid	<b>Vectolex FG</b> 40#bag: \$236.00	No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus & Bti WSP; case (specify quantity)	<b>Fourstar WSP</b> : \$576.00 <b>Fourstar-45</b> : \$243.65 <b>Fourstar-90</b> : \$406.09 <b>Fourstar-180</b> : \$636.94	No Bid	<b>Vectomax WSP</b> 800 case: \$1,200.00	No Bid

<b>LARVICIDES</b>	<b>Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL</b>	<b>AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI</b>	<b>Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL</b>	<b>Univar USA Chamblee, GA</b>
Spinosad Natular G – case, 40#bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	40#bag: \$209.91 1000 lb bag: \$5,249.49	No Bid
Spinosad Natular G30– case, 40#bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	40#bag: \$588.58 1000#sak:\$14,366.49	No Bid
Spinosad Natular EC– case, 40#bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid	<i>Spinosad Natular 2EC</i> 5 gal case: \$4,752.20	No Bid
Spinosad Natular T30 - 400 tablets/case	No Bid	No Bid	case: \$573.34	No Bid
Spinosad Natular XRT - 220 tablets/case	No Bid	No Bid	220/case: \$915.13	No Bid
<b>DILUENT OILS</b>				
Diluent oils (BVA grade 13); 55 gal drum	<b>BVA grade 13:</b> Calpar 80N 50 gal drum: \$350.00 55 gal drum: \$385.00	No Bid	<b>Envirotech 13T</b> 55 gal drum: \$1,105.32	<b>Haxpar</b> 50 gal drum:\$387.50

ADULTICIDES	Target Specialty Products Houston, TX	**Application Dynamics Cape Coral, FL
Sumethrin 10 + 10; 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
Sumethrin (Dual- action) - 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (Specify size)	No Bid	No Bid
Permethrin - 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	5 gal case: \$347.50 30 gal drum: \$1795.60 275 gal tote: \$15,197.30	No Bid
Chlorpyrifos - 30/55 gal drum & tote(specify size per drum and tote)	55 gal drum: \$1,680.70	No Bid
Malathion - tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid
Resmethrin 4+12 -30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	No Bid	No Bid
Naled EC formulation; 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
Etofenprox; 30 gal	No Bid	No Bid
Dichlorvos; strips (specify quantity)	<b>Nuvan Prostrips Plus</b> 1 case = 36 pk, 1 pk = 3x65gram \$834.84 per case (\$23.19/pk)	No Bid
Barrier Product (specify container size – include SDS/label)	<b>Premethrin 10%</b> \$206.88 per case (4 gallons)	

<b>ADULTICIDES</b>	<b>Target Specialty Products Houston, TX</b>	<b>**Application Dynamics Cape Coral, FL</b>
<b>LARVICIDES</b>		
Altosid XR Briquets – 220 case	No Bid	No Bid
Altosid XR Ingots – 220 case	No Bid	No Bid
Altosid SR-20 - 5 gal case	No Bid	No Bid
Altosid Pellets - 44#case	No Bid	No Bid
Altosid XR-G - 40#bag & 1,000 #supersack	No Bid	No Bid
Altosid SBG - 40#bag & 1,000 #supersack	No Bid	No Bid

<b>LARVICIDES</b>	<b>Target Specialty Products Houston, TX</b>	<b>**Application Dynamics Cape Coral, FL</b>
Altosid WSP - 800 case	No Bid	No Bid
Mono-molecular Larvicide Films; 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
Non-separating/ settling laticiding oil; 55 gal drum	<b>BVA - Larvicide Oil</b> 55 gal drum: \$520.98	No Bid
Bti (all available particle size) - 40#bag - 1200#bag - 1600#bag supersack	No Bid	No Bid
<i>Bacillus sphaerius</i> WSP - 800 case	No Bid	No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus - (all available particle sizes) - 40#bag	No Bid	No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus & Bti WSP; case (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid

<b>LARVICIDES</b>	<b>Target Specialty Products Houston, TX</b>	<b>**Application Dynamics Cape Coral, FL</b>
Spinosad Natular G – case, 40#bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid
Spinosad Natular G30– case, 40#bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid
Spinosad Natular EC– case, 40#bag (specify quantity)	No Bid	No Bid
Spinosad Natular T30 - 400 tablets/case	No Bid	No Bid
Spinosad Natular XRT - 220 tablets/case	No Bid	No Bid
<b>DILUENT OILS</b>		
Diluent oils (BVA grade 13); 55 gal drum	<b><i>BVA grade 13:</i></b> 55 gal drum: \$387.55	No Bid
		<b><i>Mosquito Down</i></b> 5 gallon bucket: \$1,000 for bucket

\*\*WBE