

Mosquito Control Chemicals Recap

RFQ 14-0062-5

RFQ DUE: JUNE 11, 2014 @ 2:00PM

ADULTICIDES	Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Univar USA Chamblee, GA
Sumethrin 10 + 10; 30 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	30 gal: \$6,764.13	No Bid
Sumithrin (Dual-action) - 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (Specify size)	No Bid	No Bid	Duet 5 gal: \$986.19 30 gal: \$5,809.93 55 gal: \$10,108.45 275 gal tote: \$50,111.86	No Bid
Permethrin - 5 gal case, 30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	Permanone 10 EC: No Bid Permanone (RTU): No Bid Permanone 3166: 4 gal case:\$149.56/gal 30 gal drum:\$118.35/g 275 gal tote: \$109.00/g Permanone 3030: 30 gal drum:\$111.90/g 275 gal tote:\$103.42	Evoluer 4-4 2.5 gal: \$17.50/g 30 gal: \$17.50/g 55 gal: \$17.00/g 275 gal: \$16.25/g Evoluer 30-30 2.5 gal: \$56.88/g 30 gal: \$56.88/g 55 gal: \$56.88/g 275 gal: \$56.00/g Evoluer 31-66: 2.5 gal: \$98.50/g 30 gal: \$98.50/g 55 gal: \$98.00/g 275 gal: \$97.23/g	Biomist 3+15 5 gal/cs: \$286.76 30g dr \$1,688.16 275g tote \$14,676.20	Kontrol 4+4 30 gal: \$582.00 55 gal: \$794.20 275 gal tote: \$4,089.41 Kontrol 31-67 2.5 gal 2/cs: \$540.25 30 gal drum: \$3,201.75 Kontrol 30-30 30 gal: \$1,850.82 275 gal tote: \$15,875.58
Chlorpyrifos - 30/55 gal drum & tote(specify size)	Pyrofos 1.5 55 gal drum: \$2,182.95 250 gal tote: \$8,875.99	No Bid	Mosquito Mist One 30 gal: \$ 1,392.86 55 gal: \$ 2,474.56 275 gal tote: \$11,704.00	Pyrofos 1.5 55 gal drum:\$1,705.00 250 g tote: \$8,000.00
Malathion - tote (specify size)	260 gal tote: \$11,624.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Resmethrin 4+12 -30 gal drum & tote (specify size)	Scourge 4+12 55 gal drum: \$6,240.85 275 gal tote: \$30,915.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

ADULTICIDES	Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Univar USA Chamblee, GA
Naled EC formulation; 30 gal drum	<i>Trumpet EC</i> 30 gal drum: \$5,296.80 <i>Dibrom 14 conc:</i> 30 gal drum \$182.65/g	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Etofenprox; 30 gal drum	<i>Zenivex E20</i> 5 gal case: \$296.00/gal 30 gal drum: \$294.00/g <i>Zenivex E4 (RTU)</i> 5 gal case: \$80.75/gal 30 gal drum \$79.80/gal	No Bid	No Bid	30 gal <i>E4</i> : \$2,394.00 30 gal <i>E20</i> : \$8,820.00
Dichlorvos; strips (specify quantity)	<i>Nuvan Prostrips</i> 72#carton:\$212.569 432#case:\$1,275.36 18#carton:\$152.17 108#case:\$913.04	No Bid	No Bid	<i>Nuvan strips</i> \$780.84 per case
LARVICIDES				
Altosid XR Briquets	\$682.00	No Bid	\$682.00	\$682.00
Altosid XR Ingots	\$682.00	No Bid	\$682.00	\$682.00
Altosid SR-20 - 5 gal case	\$4,460.00	No Bid	\$4,460.00	\$4,460.00
Altosid Pellets - 44#case	\$1,102.20	No Bid	\$1,102.20	\$1,102.20
Altosid XR-G - 40#bag & 1,000 #supersack	40#bag: \$ 326.80 1000 lb sac: \$8,170.00	No Bid	40#bag: \$326.80 1000 lb sac:\$8,170.00	40#bag: \$ 326.80 1000 lb sac: \$8,170.00
Altosid SBG - 40#bag & 1,000 #supersack	40#bag: \$117.20 1000 lb bag: \$2,390.00	No Bid	40#bag: \$117.20 1000 lb bag: \$2,930.00	40#bag: \$117.20 1000 lb bag: \$2,930.00
Altosid WSP - 800 case	case: \$632.00	No Bid	case: \$632.00	case: \$632.00

LARVICIDES	Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Univar USA Chamblee, GA
Mono-molecular Larvicide Films; 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Non-separating/settling larviciding oil; 55 gal	BVA 2 55 gal drum: \$517.55	No Bid	Coco Bear: \$891.00	\$471.45
Bti (all available particle size) - 40#bag - 1200#bag - 1600#bag supersack	Aquabac 40#bag: \$62.80 1000#bag: \$1,570.00 1200 #bag: \$1,884.00	No Bid	Vectobac GS 40#bag: \$66.40 1200#bag \$1,944.00	No Bid
<i>Bacillus sphaerius</i> WSP - 800 case	Spheratax WSP: \$695.00/800 cs	No Bid	800 case: \$664.00	No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus - (all available particle sizes) - 40#bag	Spheratax, 40#bag: \$239.60	No Bid	Vectolex FG 40#bag: \$252.80	No Bid
Bacillus sphaericus & Bti WSP; case (specify quantity)	Fourstar WSP: \$576.00 Fourstar-45: \$238.58 Fourstar-90: \$398.48 Fourstar-180: \$621.66 (all above are 200 briquets/cs)	No Bid	Vectomax WSP 800 case: \$1,264.00	No Bid
Spinosad Natular G	No Bid	No Bid	40#bag: \$194.00 1000 lb bag: \$4,700.00	No Bid
Spinosad Natular G30	No Bid	No Bid	40#bag: \$546.00 900#sak:\$13,240.00	No Bid
Spinosad Natular EC	No Bid	No Bid	5 gal case: \$4,277.40	No Bid

LARVICIDES	Adapco, Inc. Sanford, FL	AllPro Vector Group Northville, MI	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL	Univar USA Chamblee, GA
Spinosad Natular T30 - 400 tablets/case	No Bid	No Bid	case: \$552.00	No Bid
Spinosad Natular XRT - 220 tablets/case	No Bid	No Bid	case: \$875.60	No Bid
DILUENT OILS				
Diluent oils (BVA grade 13); 55 gal drum	<i>BVA grade 13</i> : Calpar 55 gal drum: \$395.45	No Bid	<i>Envirotech 13T</i> 55 gal drum: \$891.00	50 gal drum:\$387.50