

BID 14-0044-3 ONE TIME PURCHASE OF FURNITURE FOR CHATHAM COUNTY DISTRICT ATTORNEY'S OFFICE

BID DUE: MAY 14, 2014 @ 2:00PM

Office Services
Savannah, GA

The Office Leader
Brooklyn, NY

National Office Systems
Savannah, GA

VIP Office Furniture and Supply
Savannah, GA

Georgia Correctional Sales Industries
Decatur, GA

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Brand/Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total
1.	LLR 79008; Prominence 79000 series or equal. Laminate mahogany finish.	8	ALE-VA21-6630MY ALE-VA53-2822MY	\$248.94	\$1,991.52	BOSS N102 BOSS N166	\$337.00	\$2,696.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$303.00	\$2,424.00	EXACT	\$319.62	\$2,556.96	GU #1030L	\$840.00	\$6,720.00
2.	LLR 79038 or equal; Prominence 79000 series or equal. Laminate mahogany finish.	5	ALE-VA35-4824MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$208.46	\$1,042.30	BOSS N145 BOSS N176	\$292.00	\$1,460.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$257.00	\$1,285.00	EXACT	\$285.78	\$1,428.90	INCLUDED WITH ABOVE		\$0.00
3.	LLR 79032 or equal; Prominence 79000 series or equal.	7	ALE-VA25-6624MY ALE-VA53-2822MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$351.65	\$2,461.55	BOSS N111 BOSS N176	\$444.00	\$3,108.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$409.00	\$2,863.00	EXACT	\$449.41	\$3,145.87	GU #1051	\$670.00	\$4,690.00
4.	LLR 79044 or equal; Prominence 79000 series or equal.	12	ALE-VA-29-6615MY ALE-VA29-	\$198.58	\$2,382.96	BOSS N140	\$239.00	\$2,868.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$199.00	\$2,388.00	EXACT	\$234.77	\$2,817.24	GU #1035	\$315.00	\$3,780.00
5.	LLR 60622 or equal.	2	ALE-EL42-ME10B	\$155.99	\$311.98	EXACT	\$381.00	\$762.00	OFFICE STAR 529-E3R2NIF2	\$255.00	\$510.00	EXACT	\$309.73	\$619.46	GU #240AA	\$305.00	\$610.00
6.	LLR 79002 or equal; Prominence 79000 series or equal.	5	ALE-VA21-6630MY ALE-VA53-2822MY	\$248.94	\$1,244.70	BOSS N102 BOSS N166	\$337.00	\$1,685.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$303.00	\$1,515.00	EXACT	\$319.62	\$1,598.10	GU #1030R	\$840.00	\$4,200.00
7.	LLR 79042 or equal; Prominence 79000 series or equal.	2	ALE-VA35-4824MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$208.46	\$416.92	BOSS N145 BOSS N176	\$292.00	\$584.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$257.00	\$514.00	EXACT	\$285.78	\$571.56	INCLUDED WITH ABOVE		\$0.00
8.	LLR 79024 or equal; Prominence 79000 or equal.	2	ALE-VA25-6624MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$232.70	\$465.40	BOSS N111 BOSS N176	\$320.00	\$640.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$284.00	\$568.00	EXACT	\$324.30	\$648.60	NO BID		\$0.00
9.	LLR 79028 or equal; Prominence 79000 or equal.	2	ALE-VA25-6624MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$232.70	\$465.40	BOSS N111 BOSS N176	\$320.00	\$640.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$284.00	\$568.00	EXACT	\$324.30	\$648.60	NO BID		\$0.00
10.	LLR 79048 or equal; Prominence 79000 or equal.	1	ALE-VA51-3622MY	\$213.01	\$213.01	BOSS N112	\$276.00	\$276.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$268.00	\$268.00	EXACT	\$320.66	\$320.66	GU #1025	\$415.00	\$415.00

BID 14-0044-3 ONE TIME PURCHASE OF FURNITURE FOR CHATHAM COUNTY DISTRICT ATTORNEY'S OFFICE

BID DUE: MAY 14, 2014 @ 2:00PM

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Office Services Savannah, GA			The Office Leader Brooklyn, NY			National Office Systems Savannah, GA			VIP Office Furniture and Supply Savannah, GA			Georgia Correctional Sales Industries Decatur, GA		
			Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total
11.	LLR 79036 or equal. Prominence 79000 series or equal.	1	ALE-VA35-4224MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$201.25	\$201.25	BOSS N196 BOSS N176	\$287.00	\$287.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$249.00	\$249.00	EXACT	\$281.62	\$281.62	NO BID		\$0.00
12.	LLR 79040 or equal. Prominence 79000 series or equal.	1	ALE-VA35-4224MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$201.25	\$201.25	BOSS N196 BOSS N176	\$287.00	\$287.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$249.00	\$249.00	EXACT	\$281.62	\$281.62	NO BID		\$0.00
13.	LLR 79016 or equal. Prominence 79000 series or equal.	6	ALE-VA21-6030MY ALE-VA53-2822MY ALE-VA54-2822MY	\$356.20	\$2,137.20	BOSS N103	\$196.00	\$1,176.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$420.00	\$2,520.00	EXACT	\$456.00	\$2,736.00	GU #1045	\$775.00	\$4,650.00
14.	LLR 69373 or equal.	2	ALE-VA21-6030MY	\$123.50	\$247.00	BOSS N196	\$164.00	\$328.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$170.00	\$340.00	EXACT	\$137.95	\$275.90	GU# 1245	\$450.00	\$900.00
15.	LLR 69388 or equal.	2	ALE-VA35-4224MY	\$87.50	\$175.00	BOSS N166	\$212.00	\$424.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$124.00	\$248.00	EXACT	\$96.30	\$192.60	GU #1230	\$158.00	\$316.00
16.	LLR 69603 or equal.	2	ALE-VA53-2822MY	\$118.95	\$237.90			\$0.00	COMPEL OFFICE	\$161.00	\$322.00	EXACT	\$145.75	\$291.50	GU #1220	\$135.00	\$270.00
17.	Remove old furniture and dispose of desk, credenza. Rm 23	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
18.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk, 60" table desk, 48" table. Rm 27	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$97.00	\$97.00	EXACT	\$70.00	\$70.00	NO BID		\$0.00
19.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 2 table desk. Rm 47	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
20.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 2 table desk. Bridget Office	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
21.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 3 table desk. Rm 26	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$73.00	\$73.00	EXACT	\$60.00	\$60.00	NO BID		\$0.00
22.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 3 48" desks. Rm 81	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$73.00	\$73.00	EXACT	\$60.00	\$60.00	NO BID		\$0.00
23.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 2 48" desks. Rm 77	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
24.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 2 desks. Rm 74	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00

BID 14-0044-3 ONE TIME PURCHASE OF FURNITURE FOR CHATHAM COUNTY DISTRICT ATTORNEY'S OFFICE

BID DUE: MAY 14, 2014 @ 2:00PM

Office Services
Savannah, GA

The Office Leader
Brooklyn, NY

National Office Systems
Savannah, GA

VIP Office Furniture and Supply
Savannah, GA

Georgia Correctional Sales Industries
Decatur, GA

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total	Brand/ Manufacturer	Unit Price	Total
25.	Remove old furniture and dispose of 2, 48" desk and cabinet. Rm 75	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$60.00	\$60.00	NO BID		\$0.00
26.	Remove old furniture and dispose of Haworth L systems. LK OFC	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$70.00	\$70.00	NO BID		\$0.00
27.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk. Rm 20	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$420.00	\$420.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
28.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk. Rm 22	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$25.00	\$25.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
29.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk. Rm 24	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$25.00	\$25.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
30.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk. Rm 30	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
31.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk. Rm 33	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$50.00	\$50.00	NO BID		\$0.00
32.	Remove old furniture and dispose of L-desk, printer desk. Rm 48	1		\$60.94	\$60.94			\$0.00	LABOR	\$49.00	\$49.00	EXACT	\$60.00	\$60.00	NO BID		\$0.00
	TOTAL				\$15,170.38			\$17,221.00			\$18,034.00			\$19,295.19			\$26,551.00