

Live Oak Public Library - Islands Branch Furniture

BID 14-0024-Z

BID DUE: MAY 6, 2014 @ 2PM

Nason, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Modern Business
Savannah, GA

National Office
Systems
Savannah, GA

McWaters, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Item #	Description	Qty.	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total
1	Recycling Center	1	No Bid	\$0.00		OSCAR4	\$1,996.05	\$1,996.05						
2	Book Truck	3	No Bid	\$0.00		WIT2187230	\$366.20	\$1,098.60						
3	Task Chair	2	77140-12	\$472.05	\$944.10	SCT-20-71MM1	\$626.60	\$1,253.20	466160MTS	\$542.62	\$1,085.24			
4	Task Chair	1	77140-NA	\$434.76	\$434.76	SZT-20-71MM1	\$531.11	\$531.11	466160MTS	\$482.86	\$482.86			
5	Task Stool	1	No Bid	\$0.00		K700-800T	\$207.86	\$207.86	HS31G	\$233.55	\$233.55			
6	Coffee Table	2		\$466.75	\$933.50	410-363CT	\$431.90	\$863.80						
7	Study Chair	4	No Bid	\$0.00		9011	\$1,720.40	\$6,881.60						
8	Side Tables	1		\$413.25	\$413.25	410-1818ET	\$385.95	\$385.95						
9	Guest Chairs	1		\$898.60	\$898.60	LUT21DT	\$872.66	\$872.66						
10	Benchess	5	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN4419CCOM	\$976.62	\$4,883.10						
11	Study Table	9	No Bid	\$0.00		OD29	\$223.01	\$2,007.09						
12	Study Chair	4	No Bid	\$0.00		1823REFX L	\$1,720.40	\$6,881.60						
13	End Tables	2		\$373.99	\$747.98	410-2020CT	\$359.17	\$718.34						
14	Stack Chairs at small desk	9		\$211.68	\$1,905.12	WK821AP	\$209.33	\$1,883.97						
15	Side Tables	4		\$413.25	\$1,653.00	410-1818ET	\$385.95	\$1,543.80						
16	Guest Chairs	4		\$897.01	\$3,588.04	LUT21DT	\$921.61	\$3,686.44						
17	Guest Chairs COM	4		\$890.31	\$3,561.24	LUT21DT	\$878.03	\$3,512.12						
18	Top for Printer Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		Price included in above	\$0.00	\$0.00						
19	Base for Printer Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		WKRA-2448-LJ	\$443.33	\$886.66						
20	Recycling Center	1	No Bid	\$0.00		OSCAR4	\$1,630.72	\$1,630.72						
21	Chair	30	Tuck	\$88.27	\$2,648.10	SCH-44-OS	\$84.58	\$2,537.40						
22	Computer Table with Divider	6	No Bid	\$0.00		WKRA-2472-LFGE	\$1,413.36	\$8,480.16						
23	Study Chair	2	No Bid	\$0.00		9011	\$1,768.89	\$3,537.78						
24	Computer Table with Divider	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TKRA-4286-LJ	\$858.03	\$858.03						
25	Conference Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TARA-4286-LF	\$963.33	\$963.33						
26	Conference Chairs	5	Tuck	\$88.27	\$441.35	SCH-44-OS	\$94.58	\$472.90						
27	Conference Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TARA-4286-LF	\$936.33	\$936.33						
28	Conference Chairs	5	Tuck	\$88.27	\$441.35	SCH-44-OS	\$94.58	\$472.90						
29	Curve Benchess/ ganged	10	No Bid	\$0.00		IM2045CT 01	\$639.66	\$6,396.60						
30	Tablet chairs	3	No Bid	\$0.00		T084-T011-B	\$1,210.53	\$3,631.59						
31	Bar Stool	8	No Bid	\$0.00		9690	\$508.18	\$4,073.44						

Live Oak Public Library - Islands Branch Furniture

BID 14-0024-7

BID DUE: MAY 6, 2014 @ 2PM

Mason, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Modern Business
Savannah, GA

National Office
Systems
Savannah, GA

McWaters, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Item #	Description	Qty.	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total
33	Bar Stool Bench	3	No Bid	\$0.00		9663	\$864.20	\$2,592.60	9663	\$971.00	\$2,913.00	R62003	\$806.54	\$2,419.62
34	Stackable Chairs	50	Tuck	\$88.27	\$4,413.50	SCH-44-OS	\$91.80	\$4,590.00	9523	\$162.00	\$8,100.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$3,921.00
35	Cart for Stack Chairs	2	Dolly	\$173.42	\$346.84	SCT-1	\$197.95	\$395.90	95-CARTS	\$207.00	\$414.00	R00062	\$328.87	\$657.74
36	Lectern	1	No Bid	\$0.00		7935	\$542.20	\$542.20	ED124444	\$517.00	\$517.00		\$556.23	\$556.23
37	Nesting Tables	12	No Bid	\$0.00		PAV 2084RETIN	\$668.09	\$10,417.08	PA12084	\$921.00	\$11,052.00	SCC-752649	\$871.74	\$10,460.88
38	Conference Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TARA-48x2-LJ	\$1,319.02	\$1,319.02	SCC752649	\$1,216.00	\$1,216.00	L2C2	\$1,133.43	\$1,133.43
39	Stackable Chairs	8	Tuck	\$88.27	\$706.16	SCH-44-OS	\$94.58	\$756.64	9523	\$162.00	\$1,296.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$627.36
40	Book Truck Storage	3	No Bid	\$0.00		WT12338820	\$495.31	\$1,487.93	V336	\$350.00	\$1,050.00		\$328.87	\$986.61
41	Shelving	2	No Bid	\$0.00		CUBBY-74-GP	\$1,362.43	\$2,724.86	WB8Y74	\$1,047.00	\$2,094.00		\$1,060.38	\$2,120.76
42	Work Tables	4	No Bid	\$0.00		JFDL-3072-HL	\$769.46	\$3,077.84	6-752650	\$642.00	\$2,568.00	6-752650	\$2,511.49	\$10,045.96
43	Task Chair	4	Inertia	\$434.76	\$1,739.04	SZT-20-711MA1	\$531.07	\$2,124.28	77140-NA	\$517.00	\$2,068.00	466160MTS	\$482.86	\$1,931.44
44	Group Meet Tables	2	No Bid	\$0.00		PETE-S-2929- PW	\$654.39	\$1,908.78	PETE 52929	\$991.00	\$1,982.00		\$1,034.80	\$2,069.60
45	Benches	2	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN-4419-PV- COM	\$512.70	\$1,625.40	BEN4419CCOM	\$818.00	\$1,636.00		\$871.85	\$1,743.30
46	Small Benches	3	No Bid	\$0.00		CUPCAKE-SIDE PW-COM	\$703.28	\$2,109.84	CUPCAKE SIDE	\$634.00	\$1,902.00		\$706.21	\$2,118.63
47	Phill Storage Units	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PHIL-3620	\$2,611.76	\$2,611.76	PHIL 3620	\$2,860.00	\$2,860.00		\$2,749.92	\$2,749.92
48	Phill Taskboard Insert	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PHIL-C-F	\$1,047.60	\$1,047.60	PHIL-C-F COM	\$637.00	\$637.00		\$643.70	\$643.70
49	Taskboard Insert	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PHIL-C-F	\$714.61	\$714.61	PHIL-C-W	\$710.00	\$710.00		\$776.66	\$776.66
50	Lockers	2	No Bid	\$0.00		5526	\$508.24	\$1,016.48	55266R	\$508.00	\$1,016.00		\$459.94	\$919.88
51	Open Shelving	4	No Bid	\$0.00		5288	\$287.80	\$1,151.20	5288	\$267.75	\$1,071.00		\$756.63	\$3,026.52
52	Desk with Return and Storage	1	No Bid	\$0.00		JFEL-3066- HRK31	\$2,340.66	\$2,340.66	54752947	\$3,088.00	\$3,088.00	MULTIPLE	\$2,200.11	\$2,200.11
53	Task Chair	1	Inertia	\$434.76	\$434.76	SZT-20-711MA1	\$531.07	\$531.07	77140-NA	\$487.00	\$487.00	466160MTS	\$423.10	\$423.10
54	Guest Chairs	2	No Bid	\$0.00		SCS-22-0H	\$276.09	\$552.18	9512UP	\$281.00	\$562.00	AVR	\$149.19	\$298.38
55	Desk with Return and Storage	1	No Bid	\$0.00		JFEL-3066- HRK31	\$2,340.66	\$2,340.66	54752947	\$3,088.00	\$3,088.00	MULTIPLE	\$2,200.11	\$2,200.11
56	Task Chair	1	Inertia	\$434.76	\$434.76	SZT-20-011MA1	\$531.11	\$531.11	77140-NA	\$487.00	\$487.00	466160MTS	\$423.10	\$423.10
57	Guest Chairs	2	No Bid	\$0.00		SCS-22-0H	\$276.09	\$552.18	9512UP	\$281.00	\$562.00	AVR	\$149.19	\$298.38
58	Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PETE-S-2929- PW	\$654.39	\$654.39	PELES 2929TT	\$991.00	\$991.00		\$1,034.80	\$1,034.80
59	Chair	3	AYR	\$96.30	\$288.90	SCS-45-OH	\$129.19	\$387.57	9512AO	\$162.00	\$486.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$235.26
60	Study Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		OD29	\$216.06	\$432.12	OD291623REF XL	\$211.00	\$422.00		\$199.36	\$398.72
61	Chair	2	No Bid	\$211.68	\$423.36	WK821AP	\$209.34	\$418.68	WK821AP	\$220.00	\$440.00		\$198.14	\$396.28
62	Chair	6	No Bid	\$211.68	\$1,270.08	WK821AP	\$209.34	\$1,256.04	WK821AP	\$320.00	\$1,920.00		\$198.14	\$1,188.84
63	Reading Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		7011090	\$655.98	\$1,311.96	WAWA24RD	\$502.00	\$1,004.00		\$318.26	\$636.52

Live Oak Public Library - Islands Branch Furniture

BID 14-0024-Z

BID DUE: MAY 6, 2014 @ 2PM

Mason, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Modern Business
Savannah, GA

National Office
Systems
Savannah, GA

McWaters, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Item #	Description	Qty.	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part#	Unit Price	Total	
64	Reading Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		Price included in above		\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$351.66	\$703.32	
65	Computer Table	6	No Bid	\$0.00		7050001	\$539.99	\$3,239.94	WAW3048	\$520.00	\$3,120.00		\$198.06	\$1,128.36	
66	Computer Table	6	No Bid	\$0.00		Price included in above		\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$363.65	\$2,181.90	
67	Chairs for small kids	28	No Bid	\$0.00		7020714	\$219.10	\$6,134.80	CLRA074	\$280.00	\$7,840.00		\$223.23	\$6,250.44	
68	Round Table for small kids	2	No Bid	\$0.00		7050001	\$624.67	\$1,249.34	WAWZ	\$525.00	\$1,050.00		\$198.06	\$376.12	
69	Round Table for small kids	2	No Bid	\$0.00		Price included in above		\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$455.44	\$910.88	
70	Computer Table single	4	No Bid	\$0.00		7050001	\$457.61	\$1,830.44	WAW3030SQ	\$488.00	\$1,952.00		\$198.06	\$752.24	
71	Computer Table single	4	No Bid	\$0.00		Price included in above		\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$274.36	\$1,097.44	
72	Adult Chairs	3	No Bid	\$211.68	\$635.04	WFK821AP	\$209.33	\$627.99	WLB21AP	\$220.00	\$660.00		\$198.14	\$594.42	
73	Cuddle chairs	4	No Bid	\$1,628.33	\$6,513.32	26243	\$1,246.93	\$4,987.72	8200	\$1,700.00	\$6,800.00		\$1,554.59	\$6,218.36	
74	Ottoman	1	No Bid	\$0.00		MAN-46R-PW	\$1,184.25	\$1,184.25	MAN46RCOM	\$1,180.00	\$1,180.00		\$1,073.14	\$1,073.14	
75	Book Truck	2	No Bid	\$0.00		WTF1223820	\$469.46	\$938.92	V336	\$350.00	\$700.00		\$377.42	\$754.84	
76	Bench	4	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN-3719-PW-COM	\$852.80	\$3,411.20	BEN219COM	\$925.00	\$3,700.00		\$981.71	\$3,926.84	
77	Adult Stools - Tall	2	No Bid	\$0.00		K700-8001	\$207.86	\$415.72	CLARA-41529	\$440.00	\$880.00		\$233.55	\$467.10	
78	Adult Stool - Sport	1	No Bid	\$0.00		K700-4001	\$199.61	\$199.61	CLARA-41524	\$440.00	\$440.00		\$212.32	\$212.32	
79	Folding Tables	6	No Bid	\$0.00		COR-CFAA072M	\$219.85	\$1,319.10	RA30725	\$155.00	\$930.00		\$181.99	\$1,091.94	
80	Chairs	36	No Bid	\$0.00		7020716	\$271.13	\$9,760.68	CLARA074	\$280.00	\$10,080.00		\$275.36	\$9,912.96	
81	Storage Shelving	5	No Bid	\$0.00		6270	\$176.79	\$883.95	6270GR	\$215.00	\$1,075.00		\$135.00	\$675.00	
82	Trash receptacles (exterior and interior)	6	No Bid	\$0.00		LOF2020	\$403.01	\$2,418.06	7935	\$496.00	\$2,976.00		\$437.84	\$2,627.04	
SUBTOTALS					\$35,816.15						\$168,516.89			\$187,598.00	\$229,305.52

Live Oak Public Library - Garden City Branch Furniture

BID NO. 14-0024-7

BID DUE: MAY 6, 2014 @ 2PM

Mason, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Noden
Business
Savannah, GA

National Office
Systems
Savannah, GA

McIntyre, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Item #	Description	Qty.	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total
1	Recycling Center	1	No Bid	\$0.00		OSCAR4	\$1,696.05	\$1,696.05	OSCAR4	\$1,912.00	\$1,912.00		\$1,696.73	\$1,696.73
2	Book Truck	3	No Bid	\$0.00		W12328780	\$380.81	\$1,142.43	V386	\$350.00	\$1,050.00		\$377.42	\$1,132.26
3	Task Chair	2	77140-12	\$394.16	\$788.32	SZT-20-711MA1	\$721.86	\$1,443.72	77140-TL	\$560.00	\$1,120.00	466460MTS	\$528.95	\$1,057.90
4	Task Chair	1	77140-NA	\$356.87	\$356.87	SZT-20-011MA1	\$627.38	\$627.38	77140-NA	\$518.00	\$518.00	466160MTS	\$528.95	\$528.95
5	Task Stool	1	No Bid	\$0.00		K700-8001	\$207.86	\$207.86	CLARA 41529	\$450.00	\$450.00	HS31G	\$233.55	\$233.55
6	Coffee Table	2	No Bid	\$468.75	\$937.50	410-3636CT	\$431.90	\$863.80	5410-3636	\$487.00	\$974.00		\$406.94	\$813.88
7	Study Chair	4	No Bid	\$0.00		90T1	\$1,276.09	\$5,100.36	90T1	\$1,750.00	\$7,000.00		\$1,192.35	\$4,769.40
8	Side Tables	1	No Bid	\$413.25	\$413.25	410-1818ET	\$385.95	\$385.95	5410-1818	\$435.00	\$435.00		\$360.30	\$360.30
9	Guest Chairs	1	No Bid	\$816.20	\$816.20	LU721DT	\$864.90	\$864.90	LU721DT	\$965.00	\$965.00		\$800.31	\$800.31
10	Benches	5	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN4419COM	\$779.82	\$3,899.10	BEN4419COM	\$785.00	\$3,925.00		\$842.52	\$4,212.60
11	Study Table	9	No Bid	\$0.00		OD29	\$223.01	\$2,007.09	OD29	\$211.00	\$1,899.00		\$199.36	\$1,794.24
12	Study Chair	4	No Bid	\$0.00		9011	\$1,275.09	\$5,100.36	1823REFVL	\$1,365.00	\$5,460.00		\$1,192.35	\$4,769.40
13	End Tables	2	No Bid	\$373.99	\$747.98	410-2020CT	\$359.17	\$718.34	5410-2020	\$397.00	\$794.00		\$405.94	\$813.88
14	Stack Chairs at small desk	9	No Bid	\$211.68	\$1,905.12	WK821AP	\$209.33	\$1,883.97	WK821AP	\$220.00	\$1,980.00		\$198.14	\$1,783.26
15	Side Tables	4	No Bid	\$413.25	\$1,653.00	410-1818ET	\$385.95	\$1,543.80	54101818	\$435.00	\$1,740.00		\$360.30	\$1,441.20
16	Guest Chairs	4	No Bid	\$920.25	\$3,681.00	LU721DT	\$904.74	\$3,618.96	LUV721DT	\$986.00	\$3,944.00		\$881.59	\$3,526.36
17	Guest Chairs	4	No Bid	\$816.20	\$3,264.80	LU721DT	\$820.59	\$3,282.36	LUV721DT	\$965.00	\$3,860.00		\$800.31	\$3,201.24
18	Top for Printer Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		WKRA-2448-LJ	\$443.33	\$886.66	APSL 4824RHNHZ	\$102.00	\$204.00	6-752647	\$228.63	\$459.26
19	Base for Printer Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00				\$0.00	L2C2	\$181.00	\$362.00	6-L2S	\$56.85	\$113.70
20	Recycling Center	1	No Bid	\$0.00		OSCAR4	\$1,630.72	\$1,630.72	OSCAR4	\$1,912.00	\$1,912.00		\$1,855.73	\$1,855.73
21	Chair	30	11050-NA	\$89.27	\$2,678.10	SGH44-0S	\$84.58	\$2,537.40	9523	\$162.00	\$4,860.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$2,352.60
22	Computer Table with Divider	6	No Bid	\$0.00		WKRA-2742-LF	\$1,413.36	\$8,480.16	6300CHB1	\$2,310.00	\$13,860.00	MULTIPLE	\$11,157.69	\$66,946.14
23	Study Chair	2	No Bid	\$0.00		90T1	\$1,289.84	\$2,579.68	90T1	\$1,335.00	\$2,670.00		\$1,192.35	\$2,384.70
24	Computer Table with Divider	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TKRA-4296-LJS EAGLN	\$858.03	\$858.03	6300CHB1	\$2,801.00	\$2,801.00	MULTIPLE	\$2,133.23	\$2,133.23
25	Conference Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TARA-4266-LFG FLG4C	\$936.33	\$936.33	SCC752648	\$741.00	\$741.00	SCC-752648 L2C2	\$691.75	\$691.75
26	Conference Chairs	5	11050-NA	\$89.27	\$446.35	SCH-44-0S	\$94.58	\$472.90	6623	\$162.00	\$810.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$392.10
27	Conference Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		TARA-4266-LFG FLG4C	\$936.33	\$936.33	SCC752648	\$741.00	\$741.00	SCC-752648 L2C2	\$691.75	\$691.75
28	Conference Chairs	5	11050-NA	\$89.27	\$446.35	SCH-44-0S	\$94.58	\$472.90	9523	\$162.00	\$810.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$392.10
29	Benches/ Curved Benches/ ganged	10	No Bid	\$0.00		IM2045CT 01	\$777.08	\$7,770.80	IM204655	\$732.40	\$7,324.00		\$694.15	\$6,941.50
30	Tablet chairs	3	No Bid	\$0.00		T084-T011-B	\$1,260.81	\$3,782.43	42041	\$1,199.00	\$3,597.00	F42041	\$1,117.58	\$3,352.74
31	Bar Stool	8	No Bid	\$0.00		9660	\$563.76	\$4,510.08	9660	\$580.00	\$4,640.00		\$497.91	\$3,983.28

Live Oak Public Library - Garden City Branch Furniture

BID NO. 14-0024-Z

BID DUE: MAY 6, 2014 @ 2PM

Item #	Description	Qty.	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total
32	Bar Stool Bench	3	No Bid	\$0.00		9663	\$965.06	\$2,965.18	9663	\$980.00	\$2,940.00		\$806.54	\$2,419.62
33	Stackable Chairs	50	11050-NA	\$98.27	\$4,413.50	SCH-44-0S	\$91.90	\$4,590.00	9523	\$162.00	\$8,100.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$3,921.00
34	Cart for Stack Chairs	2	Truck Dolly	\$188.05	\$336.10	SCT-1	\$197.95	\$395.90	95 CARTS	\$207.00	\$414.00	R00062	\$328.87	\$657.74
35	Lectern	1	No Bid	\$0.00		7935	\$542.20	\$542.20	ED1244LECG	\$517.00	\$517.00		\$556.23	\$556.23
36	Nesting Tables Conference Table	12	No Bid	\$0.00		PA1	\$868.09	\$10,417.08	PA12094	\$921.00	\$11,052.00	SCC-752649	\$871.74	\$10,460.88
37	Stackable Chairs	8	11050-NA	\$98.27	\$706.16	SCH-44-0S	\$94.58	\$756.64	9523	\$162.00	\$1,296.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$627.36
38	Book Truck	3	No Bid	\$0.00		WFT12228780	\$425.14	\$1,275.42	V636	\$350.00	\$1,050.00		\$377.42	\$1,132.26
39	Storage Shelving	2	No Bid	\$0.00		CUBBY-74- GP	\$1,362.43	\$2,724.86	CUBB474	\$1,047.00	\$2,094.00		\$1,060.98	\$2,120.76
40	Work Tables	4	No Bid	\$0.00		JFDL-3072- HLK31	\$769.46	\$3,077.84	6752850	\$642.00	\$2,568.00	6-752850	\$2,511.49	\$10,045.95
41	Task Chair	4	77140-NA	\$356.87	\$1,427.48	SZ1-20- 011MA1	\$627.38	\$2,509.52	77140-NA	\$430.00	\$1,720.00	466160MITS	\$470.00	\$1,880.00
42	Group Meet Tables	2	No Bid	\$0.00		PETE-S-2829- PW	\$954.39	\$1,908.78	PETE 82929TT	\$961.00	\$1,922.00		\$1,034.80	\$2,069.60
43	Benches	2	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN-4419- COM	\$779.82	\$1,559.64	BEN4419 COM	\$785.00	\$1,570.00		\$842.52	\$1,685.04
44	Small Benches	3	No Bid	\$0.00		CUPCAKE- SIDE-PW- COM	\$632.52	\$1,897.56	CUPCAKE	\$554.00	\$1,662.00		\$624.74	\$1,874.22
45	Phill Storage Units	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PHIL-3620	\$2,611.76	\$2,611.76	PHIL 3WDA	\$2,860.00	\$2,860.00		\$2,749.92	\$2,749.92
46	Phill Tackboard Insert	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PHIL-C-F	\$714.61	\$714.61	PHIL CW	\$710.00	\$710.00		\$776.66	\$776.66
47	Lockers	2	No Bid	\$0.00		5526	\$508.24	\$1,016.48	5526GR	\$508.00	\$1,016.00		\$469.94	\$979.88
48	Open Shelving	4	No Bid	\$0.00		5288	\$287.80	\$1,151.20	5288	\$267.75	\$1,071.00		\$756.63	\$3,026.52
49	Desk with Return and Storage	1	No Bid	\$0.00		JFEL-3066- HRK31	\$2,340.66	\$2,340.66	54752947	\$3,088.00	\$3,088.00	MULTIPLE	\$2,076.00	\$2,076.00
50	Task Chair	1	77140-NA	\$356.87	\$356.87	SZ1-20- 011MA1	\$627.38	\$627.38	77140NA	\$401.00	\$401.00	466160MITS	\$411.05	\$411.05
51	Guest Chairs	2	No Bid	\$0.00		SCS-22-0H	\$207.23	\$414.46	9512UP	\$270.00	\$540.00	AYR	\$149.19	\$298.38
52	Desk with return and Storage	1	No Bid	\$0.00		JFEL-3066- HRK31	\$2,340.66	\$2,340.66	54752947	\$3,088.00	\$3,088.00	MULTIPLE	\$2,200.11	\$2,200.11
53	Task Chair	1	77140-NA	\$356.87	\$356.87	SZ1-20- 011MA1	\$627.38	\$627.38	77140 NA	\$401.00	\$401.00	466160MITS	\$411.05	\$411.05
54	Guest Chairs	2	No Bid	\$0.00		SCS-22-0H	\$207.23	\$414.46	9512 UP	\$270.00	\$540.00	AYR	\$149.19	\$298.38
55	Table	1	No Bid	\$0.00		PETE-S-2929- PW	\$954.39	\$954.39	PETE52929T	\$991.00	\$991.00		\$1,034.80	\$1,034.80
56	Chair	3	AYR	\$288.90	\$866.70	SCS-45-0H	\$129.19	\$387.57	9512AO	\$162.00	\$486.00	R62003	\$78.42	\$235.26
57	Study Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		OD29	\$216.06	\$432.12	OD29	\$211.00	\$422.00		\$199.36	\$398.72
58	Chair	2	No Bid	\$209.80	\$419.60	1823REFL	\$208.34	\$416.68	1823REFVL	\$220.00	\$440.00		\$198.14	\$396.28
59	Chair	6	No Bid	\$209.80	\$1,258.80	WKR21AP	\$209.34	\$1,256.04	WKR21AP	\$220.00	\$1,320.00		\$198.14	\$1,188.84

Mason, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Modern
Business
Savannah, GA

National Office
Systems
Savannah, GA

McWaters, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Live Oak Public Library - Garden City Branch Furniture

BID NO. 14-0024-7

BID DUE: MAY 6, 2014 @ 2PM

Mason, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Modern
Business
Savannah, GA

National Office
Systems
Savannah, GA

McWaters, Inc.
Savannah, GA

Item #	Item Description	Qty.	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Part #	Unit Price	Total
82	Reading Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00		7011090	\$655.98	\$1,311.96	WAWW242RD	\$502.00	\$1,004.00		\$318.25	\$636.52
83	Reading Table	2	No Bid	\$0.00				\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$351.66	\$703.32
64	Computer Table	6	No Bid	\$0.00		7050001	\$539.99	\$3,239.94	WAWV3048	\$520.00	\$3,120.00		\$188.06	\$1,128.36
65	Computer Table	6	No Bid	\$0.00				\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$363.65	\$2,181.90
66	Chairs for small kids	28	No Bid	\$0.00		7020714	\$219.10	\$6,134.80	CLRA-074	\$280.00	\$7,840.00		\$223.23	\$6,250.44
67	Round Table for Small Kids	2	No Bid	\$0.00		7050001	\$624.67	\$1,249.34	WAWW42RDFX	\$525.00	\$1,050.00		\$188.06	\$376.12
68	Round Table for small kids	2	No Bid	\$0.00				\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$455.44	\$910.88
69	Computer Table single	4	No Bid	\$0.00		7050001	\$457.61	\$1,830.44	WAWW303CSQ	\$488.00	\$1,952.00		\$188.06	\$752.24
70	Computer Table single	4	No Bid	\$0.00				\$0.00	INCLUDED		\$0.00		\$274.36	\$1,097.44
71	Adult Chairs Cuddle	3		\$208.80	\$629.40	WKS27AP	\$209.33	\$627.99	WKS27AP	\$220.00	\$660.00		\$198.14	\$594.42
72	Chairs	4		\$1,628.33	\$6,513.32		26243	\$1,229.28	8200	\$1,700.00	\$6,800.00		\$1,554.59	\$6,218.36
73	Ottoman	1	No Bid	\$0.00		MAN-45R-PV	\$1,184.25	\$1,184.25	MAN 45R	\$1,180.00	\$1,180.00		\$1,073.14	\$1,073.14
74	Book Truck	2	No Bid	\$0.00		WTF12233800	\$469.45	\$938.92	V336	\$350.00	\$700.00		\$377.42	\$754.84
75	Bench	2	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN-3219-PV	\$705.11	\$1,410.22	BEN3219	\$760.00	\$1,520.00		\$786.71	\$1,573.42
76	Bench	2	No Bid	\$0.00		BEN-3219-PV	\$724.34	\$1,448.68	BEN3219	\$760.00	\$1,520.00		\$791.15	\$1,582.30
77	Adult Stools - Tall	2	No Bid	\$0.00		K700-8001	\$207.86	\$415.72	CLARA 41529	\$440.00	\$880.00	HS31G	\$233.55	\$467.10
78	Adult Stool - Short	1	No Bid	\$0.00		K700-4001	\$199.61	\$199.61	CLARA 41524	\$440.00	\$440.00	HS27G	\$212.32	\$212.32
79	Folding Tables	6	No Bid	\$0.00		CPA3072M	\$219.85	\$1,319.10	RA30725	\$155.00	\$930.00		\$181.99	\$1,091.94
80	Chairs	36	No Bid	\$0.00		7020716	\$271.13	\$9,760.68	CLARA-074	\$279.00	\$10,044.00		\$275.36	\$9,912.96
81	Storage Shelving	5	No Bid	\$0.00		6270	\$176.79	\$883.95	6270GR	\$215.00	\$1,075.00		\$135.00	\$675.00
82	Trash receptacles (exterior and interior)	6	No Bid	\$0.00		LDF2020	\$403.01	\$2,418.06	7935	\$496.00	\$2,976.00		\$437.84	\$2,627.04
SUBTOTAL:					\$34,797.84			\$162,446.72			\$183,181.00			\$224,093.05