

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser Jacksonville, Fla	Paper Chemical Savannah, GA	Central Poly Linden, NJ	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NY
1a	Vinyl Gloves, Small VPP#81075(s)	150 cases	No Bid	VPP#810575-s \$37.80 / cs	No Bid	VPP#810575-s \$24.50 / cs
1b	Vinyl Gloves, Medium VPP#81075 (m)	300 cases	No Bid	VPP#810575-m \$37.80 / cs	No Bid	VPP#810575-m \$24.50 / cs
1c	Vinyl Gloves, Large VPP#81075 (L)	600 cases	No Bid	VPP#810575-l \$37.80 / cs	No Bid	VPP#810575-l \$24.50 / cs
1d	Vinyl Gloves, Xlarge VPP#81075 (XL)	800 cases	No Bid	VPP#810575-xl \$37.80 / cs	No Bid	VPP#810575-xl \$24.50 / cs
2	Armbands, Photo Pinnacle Tech # DDSP10	5 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Flex Cluff	50 boxes	Safariland #8210-3/\$94.08/box	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Earplugs	12 cases	No Bid	\$18.48 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
5	Floor Finish Spartan #404655	48 drums	No Bid	Spartan #404655 \$890 / 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
6	Finish and wax stripper Spartan #008455	48 drums	No Bid	Spartan #008455 \$568 / 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser	Paper Chemical	Central Poly	Interboro Packaging
			Jacksonville, Fla	Savannah, GA	Linden, NJ	Montgomery, NY
7a	All purpose cleaner Spartan #003555	24 drums	No Bid	Spartan #0034555 \$720 / 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
7b	All purpose cleaner Spartan # 003515	72 drums	No Bid	Spartan #003515 \$208 / 15 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
8	Abrasive cleanser Ajax or Comet	200 cases	No Bid	Ajax #32987 \$22.08 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
9	Crème Cleanser Huskey CCA 430	144 cases	No Bid	Husky #ccz430 \$31.80 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
10	Liquid Bleach	50 cases	No Bid	Austin's #372 \$7.86 /cs	No Bid	No Bid
11	Laundry Detergent Spartan #702155	36 drums	No Bid	Spartan #702155 \$890 / 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
12	Laundry Alkali Spartan #701655	36 drums	No Bid	Spartan #701655 \$520 / 55 gal drum	No Bid	No Bid
13	Liquid Enzymes	100 cases	No Bid	Spartan #3197-32 \$35.76 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
14	Auto wash/wax	200 cases	No Bid	GLH Ind. #92131 \$25.80 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
15	Graffiti Remover Spartan # 317103	72 cases	No Bid	Spartan #317103 \$86.40 / cs	No Bid	No Bid

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser	Paper Chemical	Central Poly	Interboro Packaging
			Jacksonville, Fla	Savannah, GA	Linden, NJ	Montgomery, NY
16	Surface Disinfectant Cleaner	300 pails	No Bid	Spartan #320205	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan # 320205			\$49.80 / 5 gal pail		
17	Surface Disinfectant Wipes	360 cases	No Bid	Spartan # 108606	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan # 108606			\$47.74 / cs		
18a	Surface Sanitizer	24 drums	No Bid	Spartan #315955	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan # 315955			\$670 / 55 gal drum		
18b	Surface Sanitizer	72 drums	No Bid	Spartan #325915	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan # 315915			\$196 / 15 gal drum		
19	Hand Sanitizer	360 cases	No Bid	Kutol Soap #68241	No Bid	No Bid
	Kutol Soap #68241			\$45.60 / cs		
20	Hand Sanitizing Wipes	360 cases	No Bid	Nice Pak #p92084	No Bid	No Bid
	Nice Pak #P92084			\$49.80 / cs		
21	Antibacterial Hand Soap	360 cases	No Bid	Kutol Soap #68941	No Bid	No Bid
				\$38.82 / cs		
22	Drain Treatment	72 cases	No Bid	Spartan #309704	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan #309704			\$43.60 / cs		
23	Mold Control	120 cases	No Bid	Spartan #1204	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan # 1204			\$78 / cs		
24	Odor Control	72 cases	No Bid	Spartan #329704	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan #329704			\$54.60 / cs		

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser	Paper Chemical	Central Poly	Interboro Packaging
			Jacksonville, Fla	Savannah, GA	Linden, NJ	Montgomery, NY
25	Deodorizer/Sanitizer/Disinfectant	120 cases	No Bid	Odoban#911101-G6	No Bid	No Bid
	Odoban #911101-G6			\$58.68 / cs		
26	Deodorizing Air Fresheners	12 master cs	No Bid	Spartan#8010/14/18	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan #8010/14/18			\$348 / cs		
27	Windex Glass Cleaner	24 cases	No Bid	Johnson #90139	No Bid	No Bid
	Johnson			\$48.72 / cs		
28	Hand Soap Cartridge	144 cases	No Bid	Bay West #P95105	No Bid	No Bid
	Bay West #P95105			\$37.60 / cs		
29	Disposable Rags	12 cases	No Bid	Scott #75260	No Bid	No Bid
	Scott # 75260			\$83.36 / cs		
30a	Can Liners	1200 cases	No Bid	Interplast #s386017N	IBS #386017N	IBS#3860xh
	38 x 60" can liner			\$21.86 / cs	\$21.40 / cs	\$19.70 / cs
30b	Can Liners	600 cases	No Bid	Interplast #EC2433N	IBS #EC2433N	IBS#EC2433I
	24" x 33" can liner			\$12.62 / cs	\$13.60 / cs	\$12.94 / cs
30c	Can Liners	100 cases	No Bid	PITT Plastic #385820	PITT Plastic #385820	IBS INT 3858 Super XXH
	38" x 58" can liner			\$29.40 / cs	\$24.10 / cs	\$38.48 / cs
31	Handi-Pads	100 cases	No Bid	#1 Network inc.	No Bid	No Bid
	100% pure felted cotton, 4" x 4"			#56221 Int / \$123.60 /cs		
32	Mop Head	1200 cases	No Bid	Crystal Lake #14616		No Bid
	24 oz cotton mop head			\$24.48 / dz		

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser Jacksonville, Fla	Paper Chemical Savannah, GA	Central Poly Linden, NJ	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NY
33	Mop Handle Crystal Lake #12642	600 each	No Bid	Crystal Lake #12642 \$4.82 / each	No Bid	No Bid
34	Wringer/Bucket	100 each	No Bid	Continental #33539yw \$41.98 / each	No Bid	No Bid
35	Wet Floor Sign	10 cases	No Bid	Better Brush 150325 10 per cs/\$46.80/cs	No Bid	No Bid
36	Scrubbing Pads 6' x 9" green scrubbing pads	200 cases	No Bid	Royal #S960 \$10.80 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
37a	Floor Polishing Pads - Natural 19"/20" polishing pad	300 cases	No Bid	Americo 401819 \$11.69 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
37b	Floor Polishing Pads - White 19"/20" polishing pad	500 cases	No Bid	Americo 401219 \$11.35 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
37c	Floor Polishing Pads - Blue 27" Hi-performance polishing pad PCS-TC27BI 27"		No Bid	PCS-TC27BI 27" \$11.68 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
38a	Floor Scrubbing - Red Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat 28" edge scrubber 14" x 28" PCS-TC1428RD	100 cases	No Bid	PCS-TC1428RD \$21.95 / cs	No Bid	No Bid

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser	Paper Chemical	Central Poly	Interboro Packaging
			Jacksonville, Fla	Savannah, GA	Linden, NJ	Montgomery, NY
38b	Floor Scrubbing - Prep Pad	100 cases	No Bid	PCS-TC1428 prep	No Bid	No Bid
	Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat			\$78 / cs		
	28" edge scrubber 14" x 28"					
	PCS-TC1428PREP					
39	Floor Stripping Pads - Black	300 cases	No Bid	Americo 400119	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" stripping pad			\$11.35 / cs		
40	Brush Handle - 60"	36 each	No Bid	Cyrstal Lake #12839	No Bid	No Bid
	Wood construction handle			\$1.39 / each		
41a	Brush	96 each	No Bid	Better Brush 180810	No Bid	No Bid
	Vehicle wash brush - 10" block			\$5.60 / each		
41b	Brush	432 each	No Bid	Better Brush 230412	No Bid	No Bid
	Deck brush - 12" block			\$2.48 / each		
41c	Brush	432 each	No Bid	Better Brush 310106	No Bid	No Bid
	6" iron shaped brush w/ 1 -1/2" - 2"			\$.99 / each		
41d	Brush	432 each	No Bid	Better Brush 280112	No Bid	No Bid
	Toliet bowl brush - plastic handle			\$.89 / each		
42	Broom - large angle	20 cases	No Bid	Greenwood 517	No Bid	No Bid
				\$42.24 / cs		
43a	Dust Pan	36 each	No Bid	Better Brush 410112	No Bid	No Bid
	Lobby style dust pan, plastic			\$5.98 / each		

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser	Paper Chemical	Central Poly	Interboro Packaging
			Jacksonville, Fla	Savannah, GA	Linden, NJ	Montgomery, NY
43b	Dust Pan	240 each	No Bid	Better Brush 410412	No Bid	No Bid
	Dust Pan, impact resistant, plastic			\$1.65 / each		
44	Compartment Tray	2400 cases	No Bid	PAC-YTD19903	No Bid	No Bid
	Styrofoam 3 compartment			\$10.34 / cs		
45	Compartment Plate	40 cases	No Bid	PAC-TH10044	No Bid	No Bid
	Styrofoam compartment plate			\$22.60 / cs		
46	Plastic Spoons	2400 cases	No Bid	Nutrabon#3642	No Bid	No Bid
	Medium weight			\$6.94 / cs		
47a	Styrofoam Cup	200 cases	No Bid	Dart 8J8	No Bid	No Bid
	8 ounce styrofoam cup			\$16.38 / cs		
47b	Styrofoam cup		No Bid	Dart 16J16	No Bid	No Bid
	16 ounce styrofoam cup	2 cases		\$33.58 / cs		
48	Paper cup - 5 oz	400 cases	No Bid	Dixie 58 Path / 2400 per cs	No Bid	No Bid
	5 ounce paper cup			\$69.75 / cs / \$43,600		
49a	Storage Bags	200 cases	No Bid	Elkay #F20305	CP358	No Bid
	Zip style, 3' x 5"			\$6.45 / cs	\$17 / cs	
49b	Storage Bags	120 cases	No Bid	Elkay #f20508	CP587	No Bid
	Zip style, 5" x 8"			\$13.49 / cs	\$44 / cs	

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		DGG Taser	Paper Chemical	Central Poly	Interboro Packaging
			Jacksonville, Fla	Savannah, GA	Linden, NJ	Montgomery, NY
49c	Storage Bags	160 cases	No Bid	Elkay #520912	CP912	No Bid
	Zip style, 9" x 12"			\$37.94 / cs	\$47 / cs	
50	Multi-fold towels	600 cases	No Bid	Bay West #489	P200B	No Bid
	9" x 9.5" 1-ply			\$13.54 / cs	\$19.70 / cs	
51	8" Roll towels	18 cases	No Bid	Bay West #0630	No Bid	No Bid
	white 8" x 630" x 9"			\$42.60 / cs		
52	Brown Paper bags	120 bundles	No Bid	Duro 80075	No Bid	No Bid
	1/6" - 50lb			\$26.98		
53a	Toilet Tissue - 1 ply	2400 cases	No Bid	Atlas #115	Atlas #125	No Bid
	1-ply			\$33.48 / cs	\$38.59 / cs	
53b	Toilet Tissue - 2 Ply	200 cases	No Bid	Atlas #276	Atlas #A250	No Bid
	2-ply			\$28.48	\$36.70 / cs	
54	Feminine Napkins	400 cases	No Bid	Hospesco #2501m	No Bid	No Bid
	Maxi Sanitary Napkins			\$22.80 / cs		
55	Feminine Tampons	200 cases	No Bid	Hospesco #T500	No Bid	No Bid
	Tampax tampons			\$56.90 / cs		
56a	Batteries	85 cases	No Bid	Duracell PC1500	No Bid	No Bid
	AA			\$40.32 / cs		
56b	Batteries	45 cases	No Bid	Duracell PC2400	No Bid	No Bid
	AAA			\$41.76 / cs		

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
1a	Vinyl Gloves, Small	150 cases	Safety Zone GVP9	VPP#81075(s)	No Bid	No Bid
	VPP#81075(s)		\$39.94 / cs	\$38.25 / cs		
1b	Vinyl Gloves, Medium	300 cases	Safety Zone GVP9	VPP#81075 (m)	No Bid	No Bid
	VPP#81075 (m)		\$39.98 / cs	\$38.25 / cs		
1c	Vinyl Gloves, Large	600 cases	Safety Zone GVP9	VPP#81075 (L)	No Bid	No Bid
	VPP#81075 (L)		\$39.98 / cs	\$38.25 / cs		
1d	Vinyl Gloves, Xlarge	800 cases	Safety Zone GVP9	VPP#81075 (XL)	No Bid	No Bid
	VPP#81075 (XL)		\$39.98 / cs	\$38.25 / cs		
2	Armbands, Photo	5 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Pinnacle Tech # DDSP10					
3	Flex Cluff	50 boxes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Earplugs	12 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Floor Finish	48 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan #404655					
6	Finish and wax stripper	48 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Spartan #008455					

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
7a	All purpose cleaner Spartan #003555	24 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7b	All purpose cleaner Spartan # 003515	72 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Abrasive cleanser Ajax or Comet	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Crème Cleanser Huskey CCA 430	144 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Liquid Bleach	50 cases	Austins 360 \$9.48 / cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Laundry Detergent Spartan #702155	36 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Laundry Alkali Spartan #701655	36 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Liquid Enzymes	100 cases	No Bid	Doyle DEO-08042 \$26 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
14	Auto wash/wax	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Graffiti Remover Spartan # 317103	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR Calico Industries	VENDOR Doyle Chemical	VENDOR All American Poly	VENDOR Bob Barker
	23-Aug-12		Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
16	Surface Disinfectant Cleaner Spartan # 320205	300 pails	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Surface Disinfectant Wipes Spartan # 108606	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18a	Surface Sanitizer Spartan # 315955	24 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18b	Surface Sanitizer Spartan # 315915	72 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Hand Sanitizer Kutol Soap #68241	360 cases	No Bid	Triple 2#44096 \$43.23 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
20	Hand Sanitizing Wipes Nice Pak #P92084	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Antibacterial Hand Soap	360 cases	No Bid	Triple S #44097 \$35.20 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
22	Drain Treatment Spartan #309704	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Mold Control Spartan # 1204	120 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Odor Control Spartan #329704	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
25	Deodorizer/Sanitizer/Disinfectant Odoban #911101-G6	120 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	Deodorizing Air Fresheners Spartan #8010/14/18	12 master cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Windex Glass Cleaner Johnson	24 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	Hand Soap Cartridge Bay West #P95105	144 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	Disposable Rags Scott # 75260	12 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30a	Can Liners 38 x 60" can liner	1200 cases	Calico 99302405 \$24.61 / cs	IBS 2386017N \$23.75 / cs	All American Poly \$30.02 / cs	No Bid
30b	Can Liners 24" x 33" can liner	600 cases	Calico #9970005 \$14.40 / cs	IBSEC2433N \$16.95 / cs	All American Poly \$25.34 / cs	No Bid
30c	Can Liners 38" x 58" can liner	100 cases	Calico #991133 \$24.90 /cs	PITT #EC385820 \$14.49 / cs	All American Poly \$26.33 / cs	No Bid
31	Handi-Pads 100% pure felted cotton, 4" x 4"	100 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	Mop Head 24 oz cotton mop head	1200 cases	Wilco A903120 \$35.20 / cs	Clake #145616 \$23.95 / cs	No Bid	No Bid

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
33	Mop Handle	600 each	No Bid	\$4.75 / each	No Bid	No Bid
	Crystal Lake #12642					
34	Wringer/Bucket	100 each	Continental 335-39yw	Bob Bark 33539 yw	No Bid	Bob Barker #33539yw
			\$48.88 / each	\$57.35 / each		\$48.40 / each
35	Wet Floor Sign	10 cases	Winco WCS25	BB-150325	No Bid	Tolco Corp #119
			\$29.68 / cs	\$31.42 / each		\$44.28 / cs
36	Scrubbing Pads	200 cases	Glit 20941	Americo 510161	No Bid	No Bid
	6' x 9" green scrubbing pads		\$14.94 / cs	\$12.70 / cs		
37a	Floor Polishing Pads - Natural	300 cases	Glit 13320	Americo 401419	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" polishing pad		\$13.74 / cs	\$10.99 / cs		
37b	Floor Polishing Pads - White	500 cases	Glit 14420	Americo 401219	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" polishing pad		\$13.74 / cs	\$10.99 / cs		
37c	Floor Polishing Pads - Blue		No Bid	Americo 27" Aqua blue	No Bid	No Bid
	27" Hi-performance polishing pad			\$13.75		
	PCS-TC27BI 27"					
38a	Floor Scrubbing - Red	100 cases	No Bid	Americo 14 x 28 Red	No Bid	No Bid
	Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat			\$23.99 / cs		
	28" edge scrubber 14" x 28"					
	PCS-TC1428RD					

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
38b	Floor Scrubbing - Prep Pad	100 cases	No Bid	Americo Prep 14 x 28	No Bid	No Bid
	Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat			\$87.25 / cs		
	28" edge scrubber 14" x 28"					
	PCS-TC1428PREP					
39	Floor Stripping Pads - Black	300 cases	Glit 20013	Americo 400119	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" stripping pad		\$13.74 / cs	\$10.99 / cs		
40	Brush Handle - 60"	36 each	Abco 01121	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Wood construction handle		\$1.98 / each			
41a	Brush	96 each	Wilco K00300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Vehicle wash brush - 10" block		\$9.54 / each			
41b	Brush	432 each	Carlilse 3627514	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Deck brush - 12" block		\$5.24 / each			
41c	Brush	432 each	Abco 00027	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	6" iron shaped brush w/ 1 -1/2" - 2"		\$.84 / each			
41d	Brush	432 each	Abco 0017	No Bid	No Bid	EMSCO #501001
	Toliet bowl brush - plastic handle		\$.94 / each			\$1.41 / each
42	Broom - large angle	20 cases	Abco 0040212UPC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
			\$44.88 / cs			
43a	Dust Pan	36 each	Continental 912	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Lobby style dust pan, plastic		\$6.68 / each			

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
43b	Dust Pan	240 each	Continental 712	No Bid	No Bid	Continental #2006
	Dust Pan, impact resistant, plastic		\$1.54 / each			\$1.95 / each
44	Compartment Tray	2400 cases	No Bid	Metro 3 comp	No Bid	No Bid
	Styrofoam 3 compartment			\$15.63 / cs		
45	Compartment Plate	40 cases	No Bid	Metro 3 com pl	No Bid	No Bid
	Styrofoam compartment plate			\$28.47 / cs		
46	Plastic Spoons	2400 cases	Calico 632494W	Metro tsp	No Bid	No Bid
	Medium weight		\$7.24 / cs	\$6.99 / cs		
47a	Styrofoam Cup	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	8 ounce styrofoam cup					
47b	Styrofoam cup	2 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	16 ounce styrofoam cup					
48	Paper cup - 5 oz	400 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	5 ounce paper cup					
49a	Storage Bags	200 cases	Calico 50122	Metro 3x5zl	No Bid	No Bid
	Zip style, 3' x 5"		\$6.84 / cs	\$6.75 / cs		
49b	Storage Bags	120 cases	Calico 50129	Metro 5x8zl	No Bid	No Bid
	Zip style, 5" x 8"		\$13.22 / cs	\$15.99 / cs		

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
49c	Storage Bags	160 cases	Calico 50137	Metro 9x12zl	No Bid	No Bid
	Zip style, 9" x 12"		\$34.40 / cs	\$39.05 / cs		
50	Multi-fold towels	600 cases	Putney P200N	Metro MF-NAT	No Bid	No Bid
	9" x 9.5" 1-ply		\$15.94 / cs	\$16.99 / cs		
51	8" Roll towels	18 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	white 8" x 630" x 9"					
52	Brown Paper bags	120 bundles	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	1/6" - 50lb					
53a	Toilet Tissue - 1 ply	2400 cases	No Bid	Metro 1000 1ply	No Bid	No Bid
	1-ply			96 roll case \$36.59 / cs		
53b	Toilet Tissue - 2 Ply	200 cases	No Bid	Metro 500 - 2ply	No Bid	No Bid
	2-ply			500sht/96 rl cs/ \$31.35 per cs		
54	Feminine Napkins	400 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Private Issue / SN
	Maxi Sanitary Napkins					\$25 / cs
55	Feminie Tampons	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Tampak #Tam500
	Tampax tampons					\$55 / cs
56a	Batteries	85 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	AA					
56b	Batteries	45 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	AAA					

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Calico Industries	Doyle Chemical	All American Poly	Bob Barker
			Annapolis Junction, MD	Savannah, GA	Piscataway, NJ	Fuquay Varina, NC
56c	Batteries	7 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	AAAA					
56d	Batteries	4 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	C					
56e	Batteries	14 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D					