

Bid Tab for 12-0078-3 Dental Items

	ITEM	QTY	VENDOR	VENDOR
	8-Aug-12		Patterson Dental	Dental Health Products, Inc.
			Savannah, GA	New Franklin, WI
1	Dental Chairw/ post mounted Performer Dental Light	1 ea	\$6,651.00	No Bid
	A-DEC 8000 performer III or equal		ADEC Performer	
2	Existing Dental Chair/light& cart	1 ea	\$814.00	No Bid
	Knight by Midmark		Knight Replacement	
3	Existing automatic sterilizer	1 ea	No Bid	No Bid
	Ritter MII			
4	Dental air compressor & vaccum pump system	1 ea	\$5,063.00	No Bid
	Air Techniques or equal		Air Techniques	
5	Handpiece, high speed four hole	2 ea	\$856.00	\$1,116.50
	Dentsply or equal		Midwest Tradition	Midwest
6	Low speed handpiece	1 ea	\$992.00	\$972.92
	Dentsply or equal		Midwest Shorty 2 speed	Midwest
7	Straight nose cone attachment	1 ea	\$345.00	\$329.32
	Dentsply or equal		Midwest straight nose cone	Midwest
8	Dental instruments	1 lot	\$1,338.10	\$745.42
			Patterson	Housebrand/J&J/Hu-Freidy

Bid Tab for 12-0078-3 Dental Items

	ITEM	QTY	VENDOR	VENDOR
			Patterson Dental	Dental Health Products, Inc.
			Savannah, GA	New Franklin, WI
8	Dental instruments	1 lot		
	Double end excavators (2 ea)	\$15.50		\$11.22
	Double end Amalgam carrier (1 ea)	\$17.75		\$14.03
	Double end burnishers (1 ea)	\$15.25		\$5.61
	Cleoid-discoïd carver (2 ea)	\$14.95		\$11.22
	Hollenbeck carver #3 (2 ea)	\$14.95		\$11.22
	Cryer elevator #30 (2 ea)	\$16.75		\$97.92
	Cryer elevator #31 (2 ea)	\$16.75		\$23.88
	Elevator #34 (4 ea)	\$16.75		\$47.76
	Elevator #301 (4 ea)	\$16.75		\$195.76
	Root Tip elevator #79 (2 ea)	\$69.95		\$23.88
	Root Tip elevator #80 (2 ea)	\$69.95		\$23.88
	13/14 Double end root tip pick (2)	\$60.50		\$88.54
	88L Forceps (2 ea)	\$61.25		\$46.10
	88R Forceps (2 ea)	\$61.25		\$46.10
	Frocep extracting #23 (2 ea)	\$61.25		\$46.10
	Root tip forceps #69 (2 ea)	\$61.25		\$46.10
	Root tip forceps #65 (2 ea)	\$61.25		\$46.10
9	Dental Delivery system and Assistant instrumentation system	1 ea	\$3,766.00	No Bid
	A-DEC performer or equal		Performer ADEC	
10	Mayo Stand/Tray	2 ea	\$254.00	No Bid
	A-DEC or equal		Galaxy	
11	Dental Stools			
	A-DEC or equal	2 ea	\$1,330.00	No Bid
			ADEC Dental stool	

Bid Tab for 12-0078-3 Dental Items

	ITEM	QTY	VENDOR	VENDOR
			Patterson Dental	Dental Health Products, Inc.
			Savannah, GA	New Franklin, WI
12	Dental assistant's stools	1 ea	\$776.00	No Bid
	A-DEC or equal		A-DEC Assistant Stool	
13	Mobile X-Ray system	1 ea	\$21,374.00	No Bid
			Planmeca Mobile X-ray	
	Total		\$43,559.10	\$2,164.46