

**BID 19-0135-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES AT THE CHATHAM COUNTY DETENTION CENTER**

**BID DUE: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 2:00P.M.**

<b>Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay-Varina, NC</b>	<b>Southeastern Paper Group of FL, Inc. Jacksonville, FL</b>
---	--

Item	Description	QTY	Manf/ Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Item #	Unit Price	Total
1.	Auto Wash/Wax (case)	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	Midlab 082-400-41SEP	\$27.21	\$1,360.50
2.	Mop Head (case)	750	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	O'Dell 5324F	\$35.86	\$26,895.00
3.	Mop Handle (each)	250	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	O'Dell C-8P60	\$7.67	\$1,917.50
4.	Scrubbing Pads (case)	150	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	3M 96N 20 pack	\$4.06	\$609.00
5.	Floor Polishing Pads Natural (case)	200	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	3M 3400N 19" 5 pack	\$11.82	\$2,364.00
6.	Floor Polishing Pads White (case)	200	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	3M 4100N 19" 5 pack	\$11.58	\$2,316.00
7.	Floor Scrubbing - Prep Pad (case)	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	3M SPP1428 10 pack	\$126.82	\$1,268.20
8.	Vehicle Wash Brush (each)	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	Rubbermaid FG9B3700 Gray 6 pack	\$6.82	\$341.00
9.	Deck Brush (each)	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	O'Dell DSB12 12 pack	\$3.66	\$1,098.00
10.	Feminine Napkins (case)	250	Bob Barker SN-C	\$25.00	\$6,250.00	Hospeco 250IM	\$13.99	\$3,497.50
11.	Feminine Tampons (case)	250	Tampax Tam500	\$55.00	\$13,750.00	Hospeco T500	\$55.58	\$13,895.00
12.	Batteries - AA (case)	40	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00	Duracell DURPC1500BKD 24 pack	\$7.26	\$290.40
13.	Batteries - AAA (case)	20	NO BID	No BID	\$0.00	Duracell DURPC2400BKD 24 pack	\$7.26	\$145.20
					\$20,000.00			\$55,997.30

Procurement Specialist: 