
 

RFQ 20-0042-3 ANNUAL PRICING FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS 

 

RFQ DUE: JUNE 4, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M. 

 Target Specialty 

Products 

Norcross, GA 

Univar 

Chamblee GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

Products, Inc. 

St. Charles, IL 

ADULTICIDES 

(Indicate brand 

name and AI%) 

     

Sumethrin 10+10 -30 

gal drum 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Anvil 10+10, AI Sumethrin 10% 

$7,810 

Sumethrin (dual-

action) – 5 gal case, 30 

gal drum & tote 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AI Sumethrin 5% + Prallethrin 

1% 

5 gal: $1,043.20 

30 gal: $6,182.40 

55 gal: $10,120.77 

Tote: $50,603.85 

Permethrin – 5 gal 

case, 30 gal drum & 

tote  

Perm-X 4-4 

5 gal: $107.40 

30 gal drum: $544.05 

Tote: $4,761.90 

Permanone RTU 

5 gal: $200 

30 gal drum: $912.60 

Tote: $7,078.50 

Perm X 30-30 

5 gal: $316 

30 gal case: $1,890 

Tote: $17,050 

Perm X 31-66 

5 gal: $477.50 

30 gal case: $2,811.50 

Tote: $25,575 

Aqua Reslin 20-20 

5 gal: $600 

30 gal case: $2,850 

Kontrol 4-4 

$15.50 per gal 

Kontrol 30-30   

$54.15 per gal 

Kontrol 31-67 

$88 per gal 

 

PCT 3-15 ULV 

2x2.5 gal/case: $326.26 

55 gal drum: $2,475 

275 gal tote: $12,375 

Aquapursuit 20-20: 

2x2.5 gal case: $559.20 

30 gal drum - $3,295.50 

Aquapursuit 30-30 

2x2.5 gal case: $620 

30 gal drum: $3,720 

Pursuit 4-4: 

2x2.5 gal case: $110.10 

55 gal drum: $1,196.25 

275 gal tote: $5,280 

Pursuit 3167: 

2x2.5 gal case:$574.24 

30 gal drum:$3,445.50 

275 gal tote: $31,583.75 

Pursuit 30-30: 

30 gal drum: $1,973.10 

275 gal tote:$17,872.25 

Evoluer 4-4 

5 gal case: $130 

30 gal case: $675 

275 gal tote: $6,187.50 

Evoluer 30-30 

30 gal case: $1,875 

275 gal tote: $17,050 

Biomist 30+30, AI Permethrin 

30% 

5 gal case: $390 

30 gal drum: $2,220 

Tote: $18,700 

Pyrethrins – 5 gal 

case, 30 gal drum & 

tote (specify size) 

(Organic Formulation) 

Pyronyl Crop Spray 

4x1 gal: $1,242 

55 gal drum: $16,030.80 

Pyronyl Oil Concentrate 

lb525 

2x2.5 gal: $966.10 

55 gal drum: $10,912 

275 gal tote: $54,558 

No Bid Evergreen ULV 5-25 

5 gal pail: $1,097.90 

30 gal drum: $6,465.90 

55 gal drum: $11,330 

275 gal tote: $56,674.75 

No Bid Merus 3.0 AI Pyrethrin 5% 

5 gal cae: $1,512.18 

30 gal drum: $9,073.60 

55 gal drum: $14,025 

Tote: $70,575 

Chlorpyrifos – 30/55  

gal drum & tote 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mosquitomist 1.5 

AI=Chlorpyrifos 19.36% 

30 gal: $1,860 

55 gal: $3,410 

Tote: $17,050 



 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

Univar 

Chamblee GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

Products, Inc. 

St. Charles, IL 

Malathion – 

tote/drum (specify 

size) 

 

No Bid Fyfanon:  

Tote: $15,446.60 

55 gal: $3,464.45 

Fyfanon EW 

30 gal: $1,518.10 

Fyfanon ULV:  
5 gal pail: $325.25 

55 gal drum: $3,464.45 

260 gal tote: $15,446.60 

FyFanon EW: 

2x2.5 gal case: $261.90 

30 gal drum: $1,538.10 

No Bid No Bid 

Resmethrin – 4+12 – 

30 gal drum & tote 

(specify size) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Naled EC formulation 

– 30 gal drum 

No Bid No Bid Trumpet EC 
30 gal drum: $6,554.10 

Dibrom: 

30 gal drum $7,014.30 

No Bid No Bid 

Etofenprox – 30 gal 

drum 
Zenivex E4 

$2,559 

Zenivex E20 

$9,311.10 

 

Zenivex E4 

$2,559 

Zenivex E20 

$9,311 

 

No Bid No Bid E20%: $9,311.11 

E4%: $2,559 

AquaZeniverx E20%: $9,311.11 

Deltamethrin 

(Specify size – include 

SDS/label) 

Imperium and 

DeltaGard 

2x2.5 gal, 30 gal and 

250gal: $196.20 per gal 

No Bid DeltaGard ULV 

2x2.5 gal/case: $988.80 

30 gal drum: $5,740.80 

250 gal tote: $47,262.50 

No Bid No Bid 

Dichlorvos – strips 

(specify quantity) 
Nuvan Prostrips 

16 gram/72 per box: $239 

65 gram/18 per box: 

$172.46 

Nuvan 3x65 gm 

$30 per pack 
Nuvan Prostrips 
72 carton:$279.52/carton 

432 case:$1,677.10/case 

18 carton:$201.61/carton 

108 case:$1,209.64/case 

No Bid No Bid 

Barrier Product 
(specify container size 

– include SDS/label) 

Suspend Polyzone 

$840 per 16x16oz case 

 Wisdom TC Flowable:  

4x1 gal case - $217 

Suspend Polyzone:  

16x1 pint case - $790.08 

No Bid Flit 10EC AI Permethrin 10% 

4x1 gal: $570.56 

2x2.5 gal: $652.76 

55 gal Drum: $6,565.68 

Maverick 12x8oz bottles: $397.92 

LARVICIDES      

Altosid XR Briquetes 
– 220 case 

$752.40 $752.40/case No Bid No Bid $752.40 

Altosid XR Ignots – 

220 case 

$752.40 

 

$752.40/case No Bid No Bid $752.40 

Altosid SR-20 – 5 gal 

case 

$4,704.80 $4,704.80/case No Bid No Bid $4,704.80 

Altosid Pellets – 44lb 

case 

$1,124.20 $1,124.20/case No Bid No Bid $1,124.20 

Altosid XR-G  – 40lb 

bag & 1,000lb 

supersack 

40 lb bag: $358 

1000 lb bag: $8,860 

Altosid XR-G Ultra 

40 lb bag: $460 

1000 lb bag: $11,500 

40 lb bag: $358 

1000 lb supersack: $8,860 

No Bid No Bid 40lb: $358 

1000lb: $8,860 

Altosid SBG – 40lb 

bag & 1,000lb 

supersack 

40 lb bag: $128.40 

1000 lb bag: $3,210 

40lb bag : $128.40 

1000lb supersack: $3,210 

No Bid No Bid 40 lb: $128.40 

1000 lb: $3,210 



 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

Univar 

Chamblee GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

Products, Inc. 

St. Charles, IL 

Altosid P-35 – 40lb 

bag & 1,000lb 

supersack 

40 lb bag: $703.60 

2000 lb tote; $34,120 

40 lb bag: $703.60  

1000 lb: $8,860  

  40 lb bag: $703.60 

1000 lb bag: $34,120 

Altosid WSP – 800 

case 

$688 

 

$688 No Bid No Bid $688 

Altosid PRO-G – 

(case – include SDS 

label) 

24x10oz case: $156.40 

12x2.5 lb case: $320.82 

$306 No Bid No Bid 10oz shaker: $163.20/24cs 

2.5 lb shaker $342.75/12cs 

Altosid DUPLEX-G 

– 40lb bag & 1,000lb 

supersack 

40 lb bag: $570 

2000 lb tote: $27,800 

40 lb bag: $570.00 

2,000 lb tote: $27,800 
VectoPrime FG 

40 lb bag: $158 

 

No Bid 40 lb bag: $570/bag 

2000 lb tote: $27,800 

Monomolecular 

Larviciding film – 55 

gal drum 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Non-

separating/settling 

Larviciding Oil – 55 

gal drum 

BVA2 

$480 

No Bid BVA2: $565.96 

Sunspray MLO: $519.75 

No Bid CocoBear AI Mineral Oil 10% 

$1,225.22 

Bti (all available 

particle sizes) – 40lb 

bag, 1200lb bag, 

1600lb bag supersack 

Bti Amvac Summit B.t.i 

Granules 5/8 

40 lb bag: $65 

1000 lb: $1,690 

Bti Amvac Summit B.t.i 

Granules 10/14 

40 lb bag: $69.20 

1000lb: $1,690 

Aquabac 

40 lb bag: $59.60 

1200 lb bag: $1,788 

5/8 or 10/14 mesh available  

Aquabac Frimary 

$39.95 per lb 

$3,995 per 100 lb drum 

Vectobac G/GS: 40lbbag: 

$75.20 

Vectobac G/GS: 1200lbbag: 

$2,160 

 

 

 

Sustain MBG 

40lb bag: $284/bag 

AquaBac OSF 

$4,350/100lb keg 

 

Fourstar BTI CRG BTI 10% 

35 lb bag: $428.95 

1000 lb bag: $12,253.33 

1600 lb bag: No Bid 

Bti/methoprene 

granular mixture 
(specify container size 

– include SDS/label) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Bacillus Sphaericus 

WSP – 800 case 

No Bid No Bid Vectolex WSP 

$680 

No Bid No Bid 

Bacillus Sphaericus – 

(all available particle 

sizes) – 40lb bag 

No Bid No Bid Vectolex FG 

$231.20 

No Bid No Bid 

Bacillus Sphaericus 
& Bti WSP  - case 

(specify quantity) 

No Bid No Bid Vectomax WSP 

$1,160/case 

No Bid Fourstar MBG WSP  
400 per case: $643.10 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Procurement Specialist: __________________________________________ 

 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

Univar 

Chamblee GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

Products, Inc. 

St. Charles, IL 

Spinosad (all 

available types) – 

case/40lb bag (specify 

quantity) 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Natular XRT 180 day tablet  
220 per case: $855 

Natular T30 30 day tablet 

400 per case: $676.60 

Natular DT Tablet  12 card pack 

$328 

Natular Tablet 50 card pack 

$1,334.50 

Natular G30  
40 lb bag: $637.76 
1000 lb bag: $15,532.50 

1600 lb tote: $24,669.60 

Natular G30 WSP CS/10P/50x10g: 

$465.14 10/case 

Natular G 0.5%  

40 lb bag: $238.64 

1000 lb bag: $5,909 

Natular 2EC 

2x2.5 case: $5,328.78 

 

DILUENT OILS      

Diluent Oils (BVA 

grade 13) - 55 gal 

drum 

BVA ULV 13 oil 

$405.19 

50 gal drum: $362.50  BVA 13 

$475.75/drum 

No Bid Envirotech Oil 

$825 


