
RFQ 19-0050-3 ANNUAL PRICING FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS 

 

RFQ DUE: MAY 17, 2019 @ 2:00 P.M. 

 

 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

 

Univar 

Brunswick, GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

St. Charles, IL 

ADULTICIDES 

(Indicate brand 

name and AI%) 

     

Sumethrin 10+10 -30 

gal drum 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,071.57 

Sumethrin (dual-

action) – 5 gal case, 30 

gal drum & tote 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5 gal: $991.13 

30 gal: $5,838.48 

55 gal: $10,153.94 

275 gal: $50,279.63 

Permethrin – 5 gal 

case, 30 gal drum & 

tote  

Perm-X UL 4-4 

2x2.5 gal: $109.25 

30 gal drum: $520.50 

55 gal drum: $921.25 

275 gal tote: $4,303.75 

Perm X UL 30-30 

2x2.25 gal: $289.35 

30 gal drum: $1,662.90 

55 gal drum: $3,048.65 

275 gal tote: $14,910.50 

Perm X UL 31-66 

2x2.5 gal: $440 

30 gal drum: $2,542.50 

275 gal tote: $22,797.50 

Aqua Perm X UL 30-30 

2x2.5 gal: $465.90 

55 gal drum: $5,010.50 

 

Kontrol 4-4 

5 gal case: $15.55/gal 

30 gal: $15.55/gal 

275 gal: $15.55/gal 

Kontrol 30-30   

5 gal case: $56.25/gal 

30 gal : $56.25/gal 

275 gal: $56.25/gal 

Kontrol 31-67 

5 gal case: $90.45/gal 

30 gal: $90.45/gal 

Aqua Kontrol 30-30 

5 gal case: $89.14 

30 gal: $89.14/gal 

PCT 3-15 ULV 

2x2.5 gal/case: $3,250/case 

30 gal drum: $1,950/drum 

275 gal tote: $17,875/tote 

Aquareslin 20-20: 

30 gal drum - $3,600/drum 

Permanone (RTU): 

30 gal drum: $845.40/drum 

Permanone 31-66: 

4 gal case:$440.00/case 

30 gal drum:$3,300/case 

275 gal tote: $30,250/case 

Permanone 30-30: 

30 gal drum: $2,666.40/drum 

275 gal tote:$24,200/drum 

Evoluer 4-4 

5 gal/case: $130/case 

55 gal/case: $1,237.50/drum 

Evoluer 30-30 

55 gal drum: $3,437.50/drum 

275 gal tote: $17,050/tote 

 

Pyrethrins – 5 gal 

case, 30 gal drum & 

tote (Organic 

Formulation) 

Pyronyl Crop Spray 

4x1 gal: $1,202.08 per 

case 

55 gal drum: $14,941.08 

Pyronyl Oil Concentrate 

#525 

2x2.5 gal: $967.36 

30 gal drum: $5,619.70 

55 gal drum: $10,034.02 

275 gal tote: $48,054.33 

Evergreen ULV 5-25 

30 gal: $357.67/gal 

No Bid No Bid  

Chlorpyrifos – 30/55 

30 gal drum & tote 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30 gal: $2,287.50 

55 gal: $4,130.50 

275 gal: $19,695.50 

Malathion – tote 

(specify size) 

 

 Fyfanon:  

260 gal: $14,710.80 
Fyfanon:  
260 gal tote: $14,710.80tote 

No Bid  



 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

Univar 

Brunswick, GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

St. Charles, IL 

Resmethrin – 4+12 – 

30 gal drum & tote 

(specify size) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  

Naled EC formulation 

– 30 gal drum 

No Bid No Bid Trumpet EC 
30 gal drum: $6,616.20/drum 

Dibrom: 

30 gal drum $7,006.54/drum 

(4 or > drums) 

30 gal drum: $7,081.50/drum 

(1-3 drums) 

No Bid  

Etofenprox – 30 gal 

drum 
Zenivex E20% 

30 gal drum: $9,311.10 

Zenivex E4% 

30 gal drum: $2,559 

Aquua Zenivex E20% 

30 gal drum: $9,311.10 

Zenivex E4 

30 gal: $2,559 

Zenivex E20 

30 gal: $9,311.10 

Aqua Zenivex E20 

30 gal: $9,311.10 

No Bid No Bid E20%: $9,311.10 

E4%: $2,559 

AquaE20%: $9,311.10 

Deltamethrin 

(Specify size – include 

SDS/label) 

Bayer-Imperium 

2.2x5 gal case: $1,006.50 

30 gal drum: $196.20 per 

gal 

No Bid Deltagard ULV 

2x2.25 gal/case: $1,017.65 

drum: $5,908.20 

tote: $48,640/tote 

No Bid  

Dichlorvos – strips 

(specify quantity) 

12 pack strips: $39.78 Nuvan Prostrip 

16gm: $241 (72/carton) 

$172 (18/carton) 

Nuvan Prostrips 
72#carton:$279.52/carton 

432#case:$1,677.10/case 

18#carton:$201.61/carton 

108#case:$1,209.64/case 

No Bid  

Barrier Product 
(specify container size 

– include SDS/label) 

Suspend SC 

$287.45 per gallon 
One Guard 

1 gal: $253.79/gal 

Mavrik 

8oz: $31/bottle 

Wisdom TC Flowable:  

4x1 gal case - $217 

Suspend Polyzone:  

16x1 pint case - $780 

No Bid  

LARVICIDES      

Altosid XR 

Briquettes – 220 case 

$752.40 $752.40/case No Bid No Bid $752.40 

Altosid XR Ignots – 

220 case 

$752.40 

 

$752.40/case No Bid No Bid $752.40 

Altosid SR-20 – 5 gal 

case 

$4,704.80 $4,704.80/case No Bid No Bid $4,704.80 

Altosid Pellets – 44# 

case 

$1,124.20 $1,124.20/case No Bid No Bid $1,124.20 

Altosid XR-G – 40# 

bag & 1,000# 

supersack 

40 lb bag: $350 

1000 lb: $8,650 

40# bag: $350 

1000# supersack: $8,650  

No Bid No Bid 40#: $350 

1000#: $8,650 

Altosid SBG – 40# 

bag & 1,000# 

supersack 

40 lb bag: $128.40 

1000 lb: $3,210 

40# bag : $128.40 

1000# supersack: $3,210 

No Bid No Bid 40#: $128.40 

1000#: $3,210 

Altosid WSP – 800 

case 

$672 

 

$672.00/case No Bid No Bid $672 



 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

Univar 

Brunswick, GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

Clarke Mosquito Control 

St. Charles, IL 

Altosid PRO-G – 

(specify container size 

– include SDS label) 

$129.60 $129.60/case 

(24x10oz case) 

No Bid No Bid 12x2.5lb canister: $356.64/cs 

24x10oz canister: $174.08/cs 

Altosid DUPLEX-G 

– 40# bag & 1,000# 

supersack 

$570 40# bag: $570.00 

2,000# tote: $27,800 
Vectoprime FG 

40#bag: $158 

 

No Bid 40 lb bag: $570/bag 

2000 lb tote: $27,800/tote 

Altosid P35 – 40# bag 

& 1,000# supersack 

40 lb bag: $690 

2000 lb: $33,460 

40# bag: $690 

2,000# tote; $33,460 
Metalarv S-PT 

40#bag: $1,152 

 40 lb bag: $690/bag 

Monomolecular 

Larviciding film – 55 

gal drum 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  

Non-

separating/settling 

Larviciding oil – 55 

gal drum 

$428.75 No Bid BVA2: $565.96/drum 

Sunspray MLO: 
$519.75/drum 

No Bid CocoBear 

$1,197.80 

Bti (all available 

particle sizes) – 40# 

bag, 1200# bag, 1600# 

bag 

Bti Amvac Summit B.t.i 

Granules 5/8 

40 lb bag: $66.52 

1000 lb: $1,662.32 

Bti Amvac Summit B.t.i 

Granules 10/14 

40 lb bag: $66.52 

1000lb: $1,662.32 

Aquabac 200G 

40# bag: $61.20 

1200# bag: $1,836 

5/8 or 10/14 mesh available 

also 

Vectobac G/GS: 40#bag: 

$75.20 

Vectobac G/GS: 1200#bag: 

$2,160 

 

 

 

Sustain MBG 

40# bag: $284/bag (49 bags 

or less) 

40# bag: $276 (50 bags or 

more) 

AquaBac OSF 

$4,350/100lb keg 

 

 

Bti/methoprene 
granular mixture 

(specify container size 

– include SDS/label) 

Duplex-G 

40# bag: $570 

No Bid No Bid No Bid  

Bacillus Sphaericus 

WSP – 800 case 

No Bid Spheratax SPH 30G WSP 

800 case: $749.60 

 

Vectolex WSP 

$680/case 

No Bid  

Bacillus Sphaericus – 

(all available particle 

sizes) – 40# bag 

No Bid Spheratax SPH 50G 

40# bag: $191.20 

 

Vectolex FG 

$232/bag 

No Bid  

Bacillus Sphaericus 
& Bti WSP  - case 

(specify quantity) 

No Bid No Bid Vectomax WSP 

$1,160/case 

No Bid  

Spinosad (all 

available types) – 

case/40# bag (specify 

quantity) 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Natular G 40 lb bag: $275 

1000# supersac: $5,484 

Natular G30 40# bag: $583.47 
1000# bag: $14,577.84 

Natular 30 day tablet 

400/cs: $618.03 

Natular XRT 

220/cs: $864 

Natular 2EC 

2x2.5gal: $5,217.25 

Natular DT 

50x12cards/cs: $321.50 
50x50cards/cs: $1,213 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Procurement Specialist: __________________________________________ 

 Target Specialty 

Products 

Houston, TX 

Univar 

Brunswick, GA 

Adapco, LLC 

Sanford, FL 

AllPro Vector Group 

Northville, MI 

 

DILUENT OILS      

Diluent Oils (BVA 

grade 13) - 55 gal 

drum 

$378.95 55 gal drum: $398.75/ max par  $475.75/drum No Bid  


