

BID 19-0049-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE JUMPSUITS AND LAUNDRY BAGS FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

| | | | | | *Nashville Medical & EMS Products, Inc. Springfield, TN | | | | CVK Enterprises, Inc. DBA Federal Supply USA Waukegan, IL | | | Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc. Scottsdale, AZ |
|------|---|-----|-----------------|---------------|--|------------------|---------------|----------|--|---------------|----------|---|
| Item | Description | QTY | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | |
| 1. | Laundry Bags (dozen) | 300 | 243628W | \$26.28 | \$7,884 | Cortech 2436W | \$54.60 | \$16,380 | UMI 253643 | \$39.00 | \$11,700 | |
| 2. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) Small (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$10.83 | \$1,625 | |
| 3. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) Medium (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$10.83 | \$1,625 | |
| 4. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) Large (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$10.83 | \$1,625 | |
| 5. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) X-Large (each) | 250 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$10.83 | \$2,708 | |
| 6. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 2X-Large (each) | 250 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$10.83 | \$2,708 | |
| 7. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 3X-Large (each) | 250 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$11.37 | \$2,843 | |
| 8. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 4X-Large (each) | 250 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$11.37 | \$2,843 | |
| 9. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 5X-Large (each) | 250 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$12.50 | \$3,125 | |
| 10. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 6X-Large (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$12.50 | \$1,875 | |

BID 19-0049-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE JUMPSUITS AND LAUNDRY BAGS FOR THE CHATHAM COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

| | | | | | *Nashville Medical & EMS Products, Inc. Springfield, TN | | | CVK Enterprises, Inc. DBA Federal Supply USA Waukegan, IL | | | | Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc. Scottsdale, AZ |
|------|--|------|--------------|------------|---|--------------|------------|---|--------------|------------|----------|---|
| Item | Description | QTY | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | |
| 11. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 7X-Large (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$13.00 | \$1,950 | |
| 12. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 8X-Large (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$13.00 | \$1,950 | |
| 13. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 9X-Large (each) | 150 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$13.60 | \$2,040 | |
| 14. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 10X-Large (each) | 100 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-907 | \$14.00 | \$1,400 | |
| 15. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) Small (each) | 300 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.10 | \$3,030 | |
| 16. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) Medium (each) | 300 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.10 | \$3,030 | |
| 17. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) Large (each) | 300 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.10 | \$3,030 | |
| 18. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) X-Large (each) | 1000 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.10 | \$10,100 | |
| 19. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 2X-Large (each) | 1000 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.10 | \$10,100 | |
| 20. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 3X-Large (each) | 1000 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.60 | \$10,600 | |

BID 19-0049-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE JUMPSUITS AND LAUNDRY BAGS FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

| | | | | | *Nashville Medical & EMS Products, Inc. Springfield, TN | | | | CVK Enterprises, Inc. DBA Federal Supply USA Waukegan, IL | | | | Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc. Scottsdale, AZ |
|------|--|------|------------------|------------|---|--------------|------------|-----------------|---|------------|------------------|--|---|
| Item | Description | QTY | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | | |
| 21. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 4X-Large (each) | 1000 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.95 | \$10,950 | | |
| 22. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 5X-Large (each) | 1000 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.95 | \$10,950 | | |
| 23. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 6X-Large (each) | 500 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$10.95 | \$5,475 | | |
| 24. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 7X - 10X-Large (each) | 1000 | | | \$0 | No Bid | | \$0 | UMI 10-91 | \$11.25 | \$11,250 | | |
| | | | TOTAL BID | | \$7,884 | | | \$16,380 | | | \$118,529 | | |

BID 19-0049-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE JUMPSUITS AND LAUNDRY BAGS FOR THE CHATHAM COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

| Item | Description | QTY | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | *Acme Supply Co., LTD Glen Cove, NY | | Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay-Varina, NC | | **Charm Tex Brooklyn, NY | | |
|------|---|-----|-----------------|---------------|---|-----------------|--|----------|-----------------------------|---------------|---------|
| | | | | | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total |
| 1. | Laundry Bags (dozen) | 300 | | | \$0 | W236 | \$34.20 | \$10,260 | BAG - SL2436WT | \$24.54 | \$7,362 |
| 2. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) Small (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$11.00 | \$1,650 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$1,800 | J | \$13.90 | \$2,085 |
| 3. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) Medium (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$11.00 | \$1,650 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$1,800 | J | \$13.90 | \$2,085 |
| 4. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) Large (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$11.00 | \$1,650 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$1,800 | J | \$13.90 | \$2,085 |
| 5. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) X-Large (each) | 250 | ACME 747OR | \$12.00 | \$3,000 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$3,000 | J | \$13.90 | \$3,475 |
| 6. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 2X-Large (each) | 250 | ACME 747OR | \$13.00 | \$3,250 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$3,000 | J | \$13.90 | \$3,475 |
| 7. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 3X-Large (each) | 250 | ACME 747OR | \$13.00 | \$3,250 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$3,000 | J | \$14.54 | \$3,635 |
| 8. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 4X-Large (each) | 250 | ACME 747OR | \$13.00 | \$3,250 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$3,000 | J | \$14.90 | \$3,725 |
| 9. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 5X-Large (each) | 250 | ACME 747OR | \$13.00 | \$3,250 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$3,000 | J | \$15.54 | \$3,885 |
| 10. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 6X-Large (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$13.00 | \$1,950 | OJSN | \$12.00 | \$1,800 | J | \$15.90 | \$2,385 |
| 11. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 7X-Large (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$13.00 | \$1,950 | OJSN | \$15.00 | \$2,250 | J | \$16.54 | \$2,481 |

BID 19-0049-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE JUMPSUITS AND LAUNDRY BAGS FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

| Item | Description | QTY | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | *Acme Supply Co., LTD Glen Cove, NY | | Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay-Varina, NC | | **Charm Tex Brooklyn, NY | | |
|------|--|------|-----------------|---------------|---|---|--|----------|-----------------------------|---------------|----------|
| | | | | | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total |
| 12. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 8X-Large (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$14.00 | \$2,100 | OJSN | \$15.00 | \$2,250 | | \$16.90 | \$2,535 |
| 13. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 9X-Large (each) | 150 | ACME 747OR | \$14.00 | \$2,100 | OJSN | \$15.00 | \$2,250 | | \$17.54 | \$2,631 |
| 14. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Orange) 10X-Large (each) | 100 | ACME 747OR | \$14.00 | \$1,400 | OJSN | \$15.00 | \$1,500 | | \$17.90 | \$1,790 |
| 15. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) Small (each) | 300 | ACME 69400 | \$12.00 | \$3,600 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$3,600 | | \$13.90 | \$4,170 |
| 16. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) Medium (each) | 300 | ACME 69400 | \$12.00 | \$3,600 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$3,600 | | \$13.90 | \$4,170 |
| 17. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) Large (each) | 300 | ACME 69400 | \$12.00 | \$3,600 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$3,600 | | \$13.90 | \$4,170 |
| 18. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) X-Large (each) | 1000 | ACME 69400 | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | | \$13.90 | \$13,900 |
| 19. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 2X-Large (each) | 1000 | ACME 69400 | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | | \$13.90 | \$13,900 |

BID 19-0049-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR INMATE JUMPSUITS AND LAUNDRY BAGS FOR THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MAY 21, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

| Item | Description | QTY | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | *Acme Supply Co., LTD Glen Cove, NY | | Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay-Varina, NC | | **Charm Tex Brooklyn, NY | | |
|------|---|------|----------------------|---------------|---|---|--|------------------|-----------------------------|---------------|------------------|
| | | | | | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total | Manf/ Item # | Unit Price | Total |
| 20. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 3X-Large (each) | 1000 | ACME 69400 | \$13.00 | \$13,000 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | | \$14.54 | \$14,540 |
| 21. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 4X-Large (each) | 1000 | ACME 69400 | \$13.00 | \$13,000 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | | \$14.90 | \$14,900 |
| 22. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 5X-Large (each) | 1000 | ACME 69400 | \$13.00 | \$13,000 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$12,000 | | \$15.54 | \$15,540 |
| 23. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 6X-Large (each) | 500 | ACME 69400 | \$13.00 | \$6,500 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$12.00 | \$6,000 | | \$15.90 | \$7,950 |
| 24. | Inmate Jumpsuits (Navy Blue, Green, Tan) 7X - 10X-Large (each) | 1000 | ACME 69400 | \$14.00 | \$14,000 | OJSN 24220 (GREEN), 24212 (NAVY, 24218 (TAN) | \$15.00 | \$15,000 | | \$16.54 | \$16,540 |
| | | | TOTAL BID | | \$124,750 | | | \$132,510 | | | \$153,414 |

*MBE

**WBE

Procurement Specialist:

