

Item	Description	Qty.	Manf/ Model #	Unit Price	Total Bid	Manf/ Model#	Unit Price	Total Bid	Manf/ Model#	Unit Price	Total Bid	Manf/ Model#	Unit Price	Total Bid
			Gulf States Distributors, Inc. Montgomery, AL			RTP Armor, LLC Lincoln, NE			Smyrna Police Distributors Smyrna, GA			Dana Safety Supply Sugar Hill, GA		
1.	9mm (23732) L9MM2 L 9MM LUG 147 FMJ	100,000 Rounds	Specr 53620 1000rd case	\$189	\$18,900	Remington #L9MM9	\$0.25	\$25,000	Remington L9MM2L 23732	\$0.180	\$18,000	Sig Sauer E9mmB3-50 Box of 59	\$12.24	\$24,480
2.	9mm (29353) GSB9MMC R 9MM LUG 147 BJHP BONDED	5,000 Rounds	Specr 53619 1000rd case	\$330	\$1,650	Remington #GSB9MMC	\$0.50	\$2,500	Remington GSB9MMCR 29353	\$0.537	\$2,685	Sig Sauer E9mmA3B-LE Box of 50	\$17.67	\$1,767
3.	Remington 12 Gauge reduced coil (#20285)	2,500 Rounds	Federal LE127-RS 250rd case	\$129	\$1,290	Remington #20285	\$0.85	\$2,125	Remington 20285	\$0.682	\$1,705	No Bid		
4.	Remington 12 Gauge Buckshot reduced coil (#20644)	12,500 Rounds	Federal LE132-00 250rd case	\$129	\$6,450			No Bid	Remington 20644	\$0.676	\$8,450	No Bid		
5.	ALS1212T Tail stabilized 12 gauged bean bag	10,000 Rounds	No Bid					No Bid	CTS 2581 Super sock	\$6.250	\$62,500	Combined Tactical Systems #2581 Box of 5	\$5.35	\$53,500
6.	.223 60gr Urban TAP ammo rounds (HOR83286)	10,000 Rounds	Hornady 83286 200rd case	\$119	\$5,950	Hornady #HOR83286	\$0.99	\$9,900	Hornady 83286	\$0.673	\$6,730	No Bid		
7.	.223 FR120 55gr Spire Point ammo rounds (NS-AMMO2)	60,000 Rounds	Hornady Frontier FR120 500rd case	\$154	\$18,480	Hornady #FR120	\$0.37	\$22,200	Hornady Frontier FR120	\$0.317	\$19,020	Sig Sugar E223H1 Box of 20	\$16.89	\$50,670
			<b>TOTAL BID</b>		<b>\$52,720</b>			<b>\$61,725</b>			<b>\$119,090</b>			<b>\$130,417</b>

Procurement Specialist:

