

BID 19-0028-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES AT THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MARCH 14, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

					Central Poly-Bag Corp. Linden, NJ				** Interboro Packaging Corporation Montgomery, NY				Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay-Varina, NC			Paper Chemical Supply Co. Pooler, GA
Item	Description	QTY	Manf/Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/Item #	Unit Price	Total		Total
1.	Vinyl Gloves - Small (cases)	150			\$0.00	First Care/JobGuard SM-VPPG	\$16.90	\$2,535.00	Safety Zone GVP9-1WH	\$36.00	\$5,400.00	Safety Zone GVP9-SM-1WH	\$23.48	\$3,522.00		
2.	Vinyl Gloves - Medium (cases)	300			\$0.00	Med Pride/Elara-Med Med-VPPG	\$18.20	\$5,460.00	Safety Zone GVP9-1WH	\$36.00	\$10,800.00	Safety Zone GVP9-MD-1WH	\$23.48	\$7,044.00		
3.	Vinyl Gloves - Large (cases)	600			\$0.00	Med Pride/Elara LG-VPPG	\$18.20	\$10,920.00	Safety Zone GVP9-1WH	\$36.00	\$21,600.00	Safety Zone GVP9-LG-1WH	\$23.48	\$14,088.00		
4.	Vinyl Gloves - X-Large (cases)	800			\$0.00	Med Pride/Elara XL-VPPG	\$18.20	\$14,560.00	Safety Zone GVP9-1WH	\$36.00	\$28,800.00	Safety Zone GVP9-XLG-1WH	\$23.48	\$18,784.00		
5.	Vinyl Gloves - 2X-Large (cases)	800			\$0.00	Med Pride/Elara XXL-Med-VPPG	\$18.20	\$14,560.00	Safety Zone GVP9-1WH	\$48.70	\$38,960.00	Safety Zone GVP9-2X-1WH	\$34.58	\$27,664.00		
6.	Nitrile Gloves - Small (cases)	800			\$0.00	Aurelia-SM-NPPG-E	\$36.40	\$29,120.00	Safety Zone GNED	\$59.00	\$47,200.00	Safety Zone GNEP-SM-K	\$43.40	\$34,720.00		
7.	Nitrile Gloves - Medium (cases)	800			\$0.00	Aurelia-Med-NPPG-E	\$36.40	\$29,120.00	Safety Zone GNED	\$59.00	\$47,200.00	Safety Zone GNEP-MD-K	\$43.40	\$34,720.00		
8.	Nitrile Gloves - Large (cases)	800			\$0.00	Aurelia-LG-NPPG-E	\$36.40	\$29,120.00	Safety Zone GNED	\$59.00	\$47,200.00	Safety Zone GNEP-LG-K	\$43.40	\$34,720.00		
9.	Nitrile Gloves - X-Large (cases)	800			\$0.00	Aurelia-XL-NPPG-E	\$36.40	\$29,120.00	Safety Zone GNED	\$59.00	\$47,200.00	Safety Zone GNEP-XLG-K	\$43.40	\$34,720.00		
10.	Earplugs (cases)	12			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Safety Zone RH-MAX-30	\$25.32	\$303.84		
11.	Abrasive Cleanser (cases)	200			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	AJAX CPL-14278	\$22.80	\$4,560.00		
12.	Windex Glass Cleaner (cases)	24			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Johnson Diversy JDI-695155	\$39.36	\$944.64		

BID 19-0028-5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES AT THE CHATHAM

COUNTY DETENTION CENTER

BID DUE: MARCH 14, 2019 @ 2:00P.M.

Item	Description	QTY	Manf/ Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Item #	Unit Price	Total	Manf/ Item #	Unit Price	Total	
						Central Poly-Bag Corp. Linden, NJ			** Interboro Packaging Corporation Montgomery, NY			Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay-Varina, NC			Paper Chemical Supply Co. Pooler, GA
25.	Storage Bags 3x5 ziploc (cases)	200			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Elkay F20305	\$6.48	\$1,296.00	
26.	Storage Bags 5x8 ziploc (cases)	120			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Elkay F20508	\$14.58	\$1,749.60	
27.	Storage Bags 9x12 ziploc (cases)	160			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	Elkay F20912	\$35.20	\$5,632.00	
28.	Brown Paper Bags Grocery (Bundles)	120			\$0.00			\$0.00	NO BID		\$0.00	AJM GS52NP5C	\$41.40	\$4,968.00	
29.	Toilet Tissue - 2ply (cases)	2600	Atlas #276	\$36.66	\$95,316.00			\$0.00	NO BID			ATLAS 276	\$26.68	\$69,368.00	
30.	Bar Soap (cases)	1800			\$0.00			\$0.00	Bob Barker 62107-C	\$24.48	\$44,064.00	Dukal SP30	\$20.80	\$37,440.00	
			TOTAL BID		\$95,316.00			\$164,515.00			\$344,324.00			\$416,546.16	

**WBE

Procurement Specialist

