

BID 18-0010-6 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR GASOLINE AND BIO DIESEL FUEL FOR CHATHAM COUNTY AND VARIOUS AGENCIES

BID DUE: APRIL 10, 2018 @ 2:00 P.M.

REGULAR WORKING HOURS	Barrett Oil Savannah, GA			Colonial Fuel and Lubricant Services, Inc. Savannah, GA			Great Lakes Petroleum Co. Cleveland, OH			Strickland Oil Company Pooler, GA		
Tank Wagon Deliveries (Up to Approx. Gallons)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular (73,600 Gallons)	\$0.1095		\$0.1095	\$0.040	\$0.120	\$0.160	\$0.000	\$0.180	\$0.180	\$0.199		\$0.199
Unleaded Premium (28,000 Gallons)	\$0.1095		\$0.1095	\$0.040	\$0.010	\$0.050	\$0.000	\$0.180	\$0.180	\$0.199		\$0.199
Bio Diesel Fuel (647,394 Gallons)	\$0.1095		\$0.1095	\$0.040	\$0.120	\$0.160	\$0.000	\$0.180	\$0.180	\$0.199		\$0.199
Transport Loads (8,000 to 8,500 Gallons)												
Tansport Loads (8,000 to 8,500 Gallons)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular (1,431,994 Gallons)			NO BID	\$0.0197	\$0.0060	\$0.0257			NO BID			NO BID
Unleaded Premium (34,606 Gallons)			NO BID	\$0.0197	\$0.0150	\$0.0347			NO BID			NO BID
Bio Diesel Fuel (2,060,815 Gallons)			NO BID	\$0.0221	\$0.0110	\$0.0331			NO BID			NO BID

SPECIAL RATES (AFTER NORMAL WORKING HOURS / WEEKENDS)	Barrett Oil Savannah, GA			Colonial Fuel and Lubricant Services, Inc. Savannah, GA			Great Lakes Petroleum Co. Cleveland, OH			Strickland Oil Company Pooler, GA		
	A	B	C	A	B	C	A	B	C	A	B	C
Tank Wagon Deliveries (Up to Approx. Gallons)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular	\$0.350		\$0.350	\$0.150	\$0.150	\$0.300	\$0.000	\$0.250	\$0.250	\$0.250		\$0.250
Unleaded Premium	\$0.350		\$0.350	\$0.150	\$0.100	\$0.250	\$0.000	\$0.250	\$0.250	\$0.250		\$0.250
Bio Diesel Fuel	\$0.350		\$0.350	\$0.1500	\$0.1500	\$0.3000	\$0.000	\$0.250	\$0.250	\$0.250		\$0.250
Transport Loads (8,000 to 8,500 Gallons)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular			NO BID	0.0197	0.0160	0.0357			NO BID			NO BID
Unleaded Premium			NO BID	0.0197	0.0250	0.0447			NO BID			NO BID
Bio Diesel Fuel			NO BID	0.0221	0.0178	0.0399			NO BID			NO BID

	Bid / Each	Delivery Hours		Bid / Each	Delivery Hours		Bid / Each	Delivery Hours		Bid / Each	Delivery Hours
Disaster Relief (City of Savannah and Chatham County): Daily rate stationary diesel transport load trailer with transport tank wagon to remain on-site.	\$3,200	3		\$3,000	24		NO BID	NO BID		\$1,500	24

			Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN			Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc. Gainesville, GA			The Sommers Company Savannah, GA			Truman Arnold Companies dba TAC Energy Dallas, TX
REGULAR WORKING HOURS												
Tank Wagon Deliveries (Up to Approx. Gallons)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular (73,600 Gallons)	\$0.220	\$0.020	\$0.240	\$0.0000	\$0.2440	\$0.2440			NO BID			NO BID
Unleaded Premium (28,000 Gallons)	\$0.220	\$0.020	\$0.240	\$0.0000	\$0.2440	\$0.2440			NO BID			NO BID
Bio Diesel Fuel (647,394 Gallons)	\$0.220	\$0.020	\$0.240	\$0.0000	\$0.2440	\$0.2440			NO BID			NO BID
Transport Loads (8,000 to 8,500 Gallons)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	A Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	B Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	C Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular (1,431,994 Gallons)	\$0.0191	-\$0.0297	-\$0.0106	\$0.0000	-\$0.0190	-\$0.0190	\$0.01145	-\$0.01145	\$0.00000	\$0.0237	-\$0.0342	-\$0.0105
Unleaded Premium (34,606 Gallons)	\$0.0191	-\$0.0850	-\$0.0659	\$0.0000	-\$0.0758	-\$0.0758	\$0.01145	-\$0.02145	-\$0.01000	\$0.0237	-\$0.0899	-\$0.0662
Bio Diesel Fuel (2,060,815 Gallons)	\$0.0205	-\$0.0378	-\$0.0173	\$0.0000	-\$0.0352	-\$0.0352	\$0.01357	-\$0.00857	\$0.00500	\$0.0233	-\$0.0570	-\$0.0337

SPECIAL RATES (AFTER NORMAL WORKING HOURS / WEEKENDS)	Petroleum Traders Corporation Fort Wayne, IN			Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc. Gainesville, GA			The Sommers Company Savannah, GA			Truman Arnold Companies dba TAC Energy Dallas, TX		
	A	B	C	A	B	C	A	B	C	A	B	C
Tank Wagon Deliveries (Up to Approx. Gallons)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular	\$0.250	\$0.020	\$0.270	\$0.0000	\$0.2440	\$0.2440			NO BID			NO BID
Unleaded Premium	\$0.250	\$0.020	\$0.270	\$0.0000	\$0.2440	\$0.2440			NO BID			NO BID
Bio Diesel Fuel	\$0.250	\$0.020	\$0.270	\$0.0000	\$0.2400	\$0.2400			NO BID			NO BID
Tansport Loads (8,000 to 8,500 Gallons)	A	B	C	A	B	C	A	B	C	A	B	C
	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)	Freight Charge (\$Gallon)	Overhead Difference (\$Gallon)	Total Mark-Up (\$Gallon)
Unleaded Regular	\$0.0191	-\$0.0297	-\$0.0106	\$0.0000	-\$0.0190	-\$0.0190	\$0.01145	-\$0.01145	\$0.00000	\$0.0237	-\$0.0342	-\$0.0105
Unleaded Premium	\$0.0191	-\$0.0850	-\$0.0659	\$0.0000	-\$0.0758	-\$0.0758	\$0.01145	-\$0.02145	-\$0.01000	\$0.0237	-\$0.0899	-\$0.0662
Bio Diesel Fuel	\$0.0205	-\$0.0378	-\$0.0173	\$0.0000	-\$0.0352	-\$0.0352	\$0.01357	-\$0.00857	\$0.00500	\$0.0233	-\$0.0570	-\$0.0337

	Bid / Each	Delivery Hours		Bid / Each	Delivery Hours		Bid / Each	Delivery Hours		Bid / Each	Delivery Hours
Disaster Relief (City of Savannah and Chatham County): Daily rate stationary diesel transport load trailer with transport tank wagon to remain on-site.	NO BID			\$150	6		NO BID			NO BID	

Procurement Specialist: _____