

RFQ NO. 13-0043-3 Kitchen Equipment for Chatham County Detention Center

Due: May 1, 2013 @ 2:00pm

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Culinary Depot Monsey, NY	Fortress Service, LLC Crehm Ridge, NJ	Cook's Direct, Inc. Warrenville, IL 05/01/2013	Business Services Longboat Key, FL
1.	Enclosed pan rack with J/P to include heavy duty perimeter bumper, reinforced door with interior bracing & heavy duty casters or equal. # ER-100JP	4 ea	Brand: Metro \$816.27 Each \$3,265.08 Total	Brand: Channel \$585.39 Each \$2,341.56 Total	Brand: New Age \$1,133.99 Each \$4,535.96	Brand: New Age \$1,539.98 each \$6,159.92 Total
2.	Steam table pan, full 6"D, 22 gauge, NSF certified or equal. # STP-226AJ	120 ea	Brand: Winco \$12.76 Each \$1,531.20 Total	Brand: Browne \$30.00 Each \$3,600.00 Total	Brand: Winco \$29.00 Each \$3,480.00 Total	Brand: Winco \$57.98 each \$6,957.60 Total
3.	Lid for steam table pan, full size, solid or equal. #STPL-2001	120 ea	Brand: Winco \$7.76 Each \$931.20 Total	Brand: Browne \$15.20 Each \$1,824.00 Total	Brand: Winco \$18.00 Each \$2,160.00 Total	Brand: Winco \$43.98 Each \$5,277.60 Total
4.	Cake mate, s/s 80 cut or equal. #CKE103SS	4 ea	Brand: NO BID	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Cook's \$33.99 Each \$135.96 Total	Brand: Cook's \$55.98 Each \$223.92 Total

5.	Cake mate, s/s 54 cut or equal. #CKE101SS	4 ea	Brand: NO BID	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Cook's \$33.14 Each \$132.56 Total	Brand: Cook's \$55.98 Each \$223.92 Total
6.	Dead man box bundle or equal. # 630-2116	1 ea	Brand: NO BID	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Items below are full dead man bundle	Brand: Cook's \$179.98 Each \$179.98 Total
7.	Dead man box, aluminum, all welded frame, holds 9-10" x 14" trays, Cooks Brand or equal. # JK100	1 ea	Brand: NO BID	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Cook's \$84.99 Each \$84.99 Total	Brand: Cook's \$134.98 Each \$134.98 Total
8.	Tray, six compartment, tan color, separator style, 24 per case. Cook's brand or equal. # 630-440T.	1 case	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Cambro \$4.65 Each \$111.60 Total	Brand: Cook's \$81.36 Each \$81.36 Total	Brand: Cook's \$123.98 each \$123.98 Total
9.	Lid, 6 compartment, translucent, clear color, 24 per case. Cook's brand or equal. # 630-41LID	1 case	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Cambro \$2.77 Each \$66.48 Total	Brand: Cook's \$77.28 Each \$77.28 Total	Brand: Cook's \$118.98 Each \$118.98 Total
10.	Dissolvable label, 2 x 3 by DAYMARK or equal. # 630-131957	1 roll	Brand: NO BID	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Daymark \$15.99 Each \$15.99 Total	Brand: Daymark \$37.98 Each \$37.98 Total

11.	Rack cover, heavy duty or equal. # ALC434	24 ea	Brand: Aleco \$118.03 Each \$2,832.72 Total	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Aleco \$116.99 Each \$2,807.76 Total	Brand: Aleco \$165.98 Each \$3,983.52 Total
12.	Bun pan rack, heavy duty, 70" H, 2" spacing, capacity (30) 18" x 26" bun pans, front loading, aluminum construction, 5 x 2 plate casters or equal, # 70002J9. Lifetime warranty	12 ea	Brand: Channel \$518.40 Each \$6,220.80 Total	Brand: Channel \$627.36 Each \$7,528.32 Total	Brand: Channel \$611.99 Each \$7,343.88 Total	Brand: Channel \$849.98 Each \$10,199.76 Total
13.	Beverage server, 4.75 gallon 4-3/4 gallon, plastic latch, 16-1/2"D x 9"Wx24-1/4"H. color dark brown by Cambro or equal. #BS50P	48 ea	Brand: Cambro \$97.31 Each \$4,670.88 Total	Brand: NO BID	Brand: Cambro \$115.00 Each \$5,520.00 Total	Brand: Cambro \$162.98 Each \$7,823.04 Total
	Total		\$19,451.88	\$22,718.42	\$26,375.74	\$41,445.18