
QUOTE 13-0053-5 ANNUAL PRICING FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS 

DUE: JUNE 11, 2013 @ 2PM 

Specifications QTY Vendor  Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor 
  Clarke Mosquito 

Control Products, 
Inc. 

Roselle, IL 

Univar USA 
Chamblee, GA 

Target Specialty 
Products 

Houston, TX 

AllPro Vector 
Group 

Northville, MI 

ADAPCO, Inc. 
Sanford, FL 

Sumethrin 10+10, 30 gal 
drum 

Per 
Drum 

$1515.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Sumethrin (dual-action), 5 
gal case, 30 gal drum & 
tote (Specify) 

Per 
Drum 

$971.90 (case) 
$5,698.40 (30 gal 
drum) 
$48,984.00 (tote) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Permthrin, 5 gal case, 30 
gal drum & tote (Specify) 

Per 
Drum 

$288.40 (case) 
$1,673.96 (30 gal 
drum) 
$14,448.40 (275 gal 
tote) 

30/30-$294.05 (5 gal) 
$1,764.30 (30 gal) 
$16,172.75 (275 gal 
tote) 
31/67-$524.00 (5 gal) 
$3,144.00 (30 gal) 
$28,820.00 (275 gal 
tote) 

No Bid 30/30-$335.00 (5 
gal) 
$1,980.00 (30 gal) 
$26,950.00 (275 gal 
tote) 
31/66-$510.00 (5 
gal) 
$3,030.00 (30 gal) 
$26,950.00(275 gal 
tote)  

30/30 –$581.25 
(5 gal) 
$3,357.00 (30 
gal) 
$28,440.50 (275 
gal tote) 
31/66-$3,550.50 
(30 gal) 
$29,975.00 275 
gal tote) 

Chlorpyyrifos, 30/55 gal 
drum & tote (Specify) 

Per 
Drum 

$1,541.96 (30 gal) 
$2,799.04 (55 gal) 
$13,590.40 (tote) 

$34.12 all sizes (55 
and 2.5 gal containers) 

No Bid No Bid $2,182.95 (55 
gal) 
$8,875.00 (250 
gal tote) 

Malathion, tote (specify) Per 
Drum 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,545.50 (4 or 
more totes) 
$10,748.40 (1-3 
totes) 
 

Resmethrin 4+12, 30 gal 
drum & tote (Specify) 

Per 
Drum 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,936.15 (55 
gal) 
$29,326.00 (275 
gal tote) 

Naled EC formualtion, 30 
gal drum 

Per 
Drum 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,926.30 

Etofenprox, 30 gal drum Per 
Drum 

No Bid E4-$2,394.00 
E20-$8,760.00 

No Bid No Bid E4-$2,394.00 
E20-$8,760.00 

Dichlorvos, strips (Specify) Per Case No Bid $810.00(3x65gm/pk) 
(36 pks/cs) 

$777.24(3x65gm) 
$1,066.68(12x16gm) 

No Bid NPS16/72-
$212.56 (carton 
of 72) 
NPS16/432-
$1,275.36 case 
of 432) 

Altosid XR Briquets, Case 
(220) 

Per Case $666.60 $666.60 No Bid No Bid $666.60 

Altosid SR-20, 5 gal case Per Case $4420.00 $4420.00 No Bid No Bid $4,420.00 

Altosid Pellets, 44# case Per Case $1102.20 $1102.20 No Bid No Bid $1,102.20 

Altosid XR-G, 40# bag & 
1,000# supersack 

Per Bag $322.00 40#-$322.00 
1,000#-$8,050.00 

No Bid No Bid $322.00 (bag) 
$8,050.00 
(supersack) 

Altosid SBG, 40# bag & 
1,000# supersack 

Per Bag $114.00 40#-$114.00 
1,000#-$2,850.00 

No Bid No Bid $114.00 (bag) 
$2,850.00 
(supersack) 

Altosid WSP, Case (800) Per Bag $632.00 $632.00 No Bid No Bid $632.00 (case) 

Monomolecular larviciding 
film, 55 gal drum 

Per 
Drum 

No Bid 
 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,979.02 

Non-separating/settling 
larviciding oil, 55 gal drum 

Per 
Drum 

$890.00 $453.75 $700.15 No Bid $593.45 

Bti  40# bag Per Bag $64.00 $92.80 No Bid No Bid $67.60 

Bti 1200# bag Per Bag $1,896.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,956.00 



Specifications QTY Vendor  Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor 
  Clarke Mosquito 

Control Products, 
Inc. 

Roselle, IL 

Univar USA 
Chamblee, GA 

Target Specialty 
Products 

Houston, TX 

AllPro Vector 
Group 

Northville, MI 

ADAPCO, Inc. 
Sanford, FL 

Bti 1600# supersack Per Bag No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,630.00 

Bacillus sphaericus WSP, 
Case (800) 

Per Bag $672.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $688.49 

Bacillus sphaericus (all 
avail. Sizes) 40# bag 

Per Bag $248.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $239.60 

Bacillus sphaericus & Bti 
WSP, case (Specify) 

Per Case $1355.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $568.00 

Spinosad ( all avail. types) 
case/40# bag (Specify) 

Per Bag $559.75/s T30-400  
tablets 
$883.60/cs XRT-220 
tablets 
$4,285.40/cs 2EC 
2X2.5/CS 
$551.75/BAG g30 
40lb. bag 
$199.75/bag 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Diluent Oils (BVA grade 
13), 55 gal drum 

Per 
Drum 

$770.00 $398.75 $523.05 No Bid $563.75 

 


