

Bid Tab for 13-0017-3 Tables and Chairs

Bid Tab for #13-0017-3 Tables and Chairs for Detention Center						
Line Item	Item	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
		Mason, Inc.	Cortech	National Office Systems	Staples	Georgia Correctional
		Savannah, GA	Willowbrook, IL	Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Decatur, GA
		Addendum: Yes	Addendum: No	Addendum: Yes	N/A	Addendum : No
No. 1	Office Chair 24/7 (Type B)	Basyx	No Bid	Miller @work	No Bid	GCI/Nightingale
	Brand: Basyx VL705VM10	As specified		1518-6 24/7 Task Chair		CXOHD
	Color: Black	\$209.96		\$659.56		\$795.00
	Qty: 44 each	\$12,802.26		\$29,020.64		\$34,980.00
No. 2	Task Chair (Type C)	United Chair	No Bid	United Chair	No Bid	CGI/Breathe Jr.
	Brand; United Chair Affinity	As Specified		As Specified		#240JR
	Color: Black	\$186.75		\$203.50		\$185.00
	Qty: 14 each	\$2,614.50		\$2,849.00		\$2,590.00
No. 3	Stackable Chair (Type D)	Sit on It	No Bid	In-Flex	No Bid	GCI/Hi-Density Stack Chair
	Brand: In-Flex Ergonomic (Type D)			As Specified		#920
	Color: Frame - Silver; Plastic-Black	\$106.12		\$98.48		\$56.00
	Qty: 116 each	\$12,309.92		\$11,423.68		\$6,496.00
No.4	Stackable Chair with Cushion Set	Sit on It	No Bid	In-Flex	No Bid	GCI/Hi-Density Stack Chair
	(Type D1)			As Specified		Upholsterd seat
	Brand: In-Flex Ergonomic					#920F
	Color: Frame; Black, Plastic; Black,	\$149.00		\$135.59		\$112.00
	Fabric Cushion: Essentials II, Perpetual Black					\$2,464.00
	Qty: 22 each	\$3,278.00		\$3,048.98		

Bid Tab for 13-0017-3 Tables and Chairs

Line Item	Item	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
		Mason, Inc.	Cortech	National Office Systems	Staples	Georgia Correctional
		Savannah, GA	Willowbrook, IL	Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Decatur, GA
No. 5	Stacking Armless Chair (Type E)	No Bid	Razorback	Norix Integra	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Norix Integra Stacking Chair		CORTECHUSA	As Specified		
	Model C110 or equal					
	Color: Mulberry		\$33.50	\$44.91		
	Qty: 316 each		\$10,586.00	\$14,191.56		
No. 6	Stacking Arm Chair (Type E1)	No Bid	ModoMax	Norix Integra	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Norix Integra Stack Chair		CORTECHUSA	As Specified		
	Model C120 or equal					
	Color: Mulberry		\$42.50	\$53.96		
	Qty: 1160 each		\$49,300.00	\$62,593.60		
No. 7	36" x 72" Leg Style Table (Type E1)	No Bid	ModoMax	Norix Madera	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Norix Madera leg style table or equal		CORTECHUSA	As Specified		
	Color: Black legs, Monticello Maple top		\$588.59	\$878.49		
	Qty: 6 each		\$3,531.54	\$5,270.94		
No. 8	36" x 36" Gaming Table (Type C)	No Bid	No Bid	Norix Slammer	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Norix Slammer gaming or equal			As Specified		
	Color: Black base, game top			\$711.65		
	Qty: 288 each			\$204,955.20		
No. 9	36" x 36" Leg Style table (Type E3636)	No Bid	ModoMax	Norix Leg Style	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Norix leg style table or equal		CORTECHUSA	As Specified		
	Color: Black, Titanium evolve laminate top		\$432.13	\$471.94		
	Qty: 17 each		\$7,346.21	\$8,022.98		
Line Item	Item	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor

Bid Tab for 13-0017-3 Tables and Chairs

		Mason, Inc.	Cortech	National Office Systems	Staples	Georgia Correctional
		Savannah, GA	Willowbrook, IL	Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Decatur, GA
No. 10	48" x 30" Folding Leg table (Type D)	Flash Furniture	R-Series	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Lifetime folding indoor/outdoor table or equal		Correll			
	Color: Almond	\$42.50	\$97.86			
	Qty: 19 each	\$807.50	\$1,859.34			
No. 11	72" x 30" folding leg table (Type D1)	Flash Furniture	R-Series	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Lifetime folding or equal		Correll			
	Color: Almond	\$62.50	\$126.37			
	Qty: 16 each	\$1,000.00	\$2,021.92			
No. 12	60" x 18" Folding leg table (type D4)	Flash Furniture	R-Series	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Lifetime folding indoor/outdoor table or equal		Correll			
	Color: Almond	\$40.00	\$121.84			
	Qty: 26 each	\$1,040.00	\$3,167.84			
No. 13	48" x 24" Folding Leg Table (Type D5)	Flash Furniture	R-Series	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Lifetime folding indoor/outdoor table or equal		Correll			
	Color: Almond	\$42.50	\$97.86			
	Qty: 16 each	\$680.00	\$1,565.76			
No. 14	36' x 24" Fixed leg table (Type D3)	Symphony	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Symphony seminar type table or equal	As specified				
	Color: TBD	\$280.00				
	Qty: 7 each	\$1,960.00				
Line Item	Item	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor

Bid Tab for 13-0017-3 Tables and Chairs

		Mason, Inc.	Cortech	National Office Systems	Staples	Georgia Correctional
		Savannah, GA	Willowbrook, IL	Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Decatur, GA
No. 15	40' x 30"h Hex Picnic table (Type F3)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Barco products economy Hex picnic table or equal					
	Color: TBD					
	Qty: 3 each					
No. 16	40' x 30"h Hex Picnic table ADA (Type F3-ADA)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand: Barco products economy Hex picnic table or equal					
	Colr: TBD					
	Qty: 3 each					
	Total	\$36,492.12	79,378.61	\$341,376.58		\$46,530.00
No. 17	Delivery Time Frame	4-6 weeks	30-45 Days	Appox. 11 weeks		30-45 Days