

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
1a	Vinyl Gloves, Small VPP#81075(s)	150 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1b	Vinyl Gloves, Medium VPP#81075 (m)	300 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1c	Vinyl Gloves, Large VPP#81075 (L)	600 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1d	Vinyl Gloves, Xlarge VPP#81075 (XL)	800 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Armbands, Photo Pinnacle Tech # DDSP10	5 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Flex Cluff	50 boxes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Earplugs	12 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Impact #7311c/\$58.98/100 pk
5	Floor Finish Spartan #404655	48 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Finish and wax stripper Spartan #008455	48 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
7a	All purpose cleaner Spartan #003555	24 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7b	All purpose cleaner Spartan # 003515	72 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Abrasive cleanser Ajax or Comet	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Ajax or Comet \$21.39/cs
9	Crème Cleanser Huskey CCA 430	144 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Liquid Bleach	50 cases	No Bid	Bleach pure bright #511262/\$7.18/cs	Home Depot #201824/\$10.08/cs	Austin \$7.46/cs
11	Laundry Detergent Spartan #702155	36 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Laundry Alkali Spartan #701655	36 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Liquid Enzymes	100 cases	No Bid	Enzyme Plus #920341/\$38.37/cs	No Bid	Lynx \$29.65/cs
14	Auto wash/wax	200 cases	No Bid	Vehicle wash liquid #665333/\$23.85/ea	No Bid	No Bid
15	Graffiti Remover Spartan # 317103	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
16	Surface Disinfectant Cleaner Spartan # 320205	300 pails	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Surface Disinfectant Wipes Spartan # 108606	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18a	Surface Sanitizer Spartan # 315955	24 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18b	Surface Sanitizer Spartan # 315915	72 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Hand Sanitizer Kutol Soap #68241	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Kutal Soap #68241 \$41.99/cs
20	Hand Sanitizing Wipes Nice Pak #P92084	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Nice Pak # P92084 \$42.34/cs
21	Antibacterial Hand Soap	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Kutol Soap # 68941 \$34.54/cs
22	Drain Treatment Spartan #309704	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Mold Control Spartan # 1204	120 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Odor Control Spartan #329704	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
25	Deodorizer/Sanitizer/Disinfectant Odoban #911101-G6	120 cases	No Bid	No Bid	Home Depot #166685/\$9.98/gl	No Bid
26	Deodorizing Air Fresheners Spartan #8010/14/18	12 master cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Windex Glass Cleaner Johnson	24 cases	No Bid	No Bid	# 255390/\$2.98/qt	Johnson \$64.58/cs
28	Hand Soap Cartridge Bay West #P95105	144 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	Disposable Rags Scott # 75260	12 cases	No Bid	No Bid	Scott #75260 #463256/\$9.98/bx	Scott # 75260 \$ 91.35/cs
30a	Can Liners 38 x 60" can liner	1200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.54/cs
30b	Can Liners 24" x 33" can liner	600 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.79/cs
30c	Can Liners 38" x 58" can liner	100 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	SL3585150K3 \$ 20.02/cs
31	Handi-Pads 100% pure felted cotton, 4" x 4"	100 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Git 29523 \$6.09 per 20pk
32	Mop Head 24 oz cotton mop head	1200 cases	No Bid	Rayon #20, White #852061/\$2.93/ea	Home Depot #668504/\$4.87/ea	Wilco A947118 \$ 28.52/cs

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
33	Mop Handle Crystal Lake #12642	600 each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
34	Wringer/Bucket	100 each	No Bid	Brighton, Mop Bucket #364105/\$54.08/ea	Home Depot #766056/\$49.97/ea	Continental 335-9YW \$42.33/ea
35	Wet Floor Sign	10 cases	No Bid	Rubbermaid #123828/\$10.00/ea	Home Depot #719268/\$16.97/ea	Continental 119 \$40.32/cs
36	Scrubbing Pads 6' x 9" green scrubbing pads	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	Home Depot #984948/\$4.97/ea	Gilt 20941 \$ 11.46/cs
37a	Floor Polishing Pads - Natural 19"/20" polishing pad	300 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gilt 14419 19" \$10.17/cs
37b	Floor Polishing Pads - White 19"/20" polishing pad	500 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gilt 14419 19" \$10.17/cs
37c	Floor Polishing Pads - Blue 27" Hi-performance polishing pad PCS-TC27BI 27"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38a	Floor Scrubbing - Red Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat 28" edge scrubber 14" x 28" PCS-TC1428RD	100 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
38b	Floor Scrubbing - Prep Pad	100 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No bid
	Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat					
	28" edge scrubber 14" x 28"					
	PCS-TC1428PREP					
39	Floor Stripping Pads - Black	300 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Gilt 20013 19"
	19"/20" stripping pad					\$10.17/cs
40	Brush Handle - 60"	36 each	No Bid	Pro-Line Metal	No Bid	Wilco M101060
	Wood construction handle			#818769/\$2.39/ea		\$ 2.24/ea/MOR 12 ea
41a	Brush	96 each	No Bid	Palmyra, 16 in	No Bid	Wilco K003000
	Vehicle wash brush - 10" block			#727506/\$6.13/ea		\$7.91/ea/MOR 12 ea
41b	Brush	432 each	No Bid	Palmyra, 16 in	No Bid	Wilco I003010
	Deck brush - 12" block			#727506/\$5.31/ea		\$3.95/ea/MOR 24 ea
41c	Brush	432 each	No Bid	6 in iron handle	No Bid	Wilco I601000
	6" iron shaped brush w/ 1 -1/2" - 2"			#733070/\$1.52/ea		\$1.40/ea/MOR 12 ea
41d	Brush	432 each	No Bid	Impact	Home Depot	Wilco WJ510000
	Toliet bowl brush - plastic handle			#186890/#3.22/ea	#481089/\$1.98/ea	\$.56/ea/MOR 144 ea
42	Broom - large angle	20 cases	No Bid	Large yellow angle	Home Depot	00709 Angle Broom
				#727887/\$71.40/cs	#575256/\$119.64/cs	\$ 53.04/per 12 pk
43a	Dust Pan	36 each	No Bid	Rubbermaid	Home Depot	Continental 912BK
	Lobby style dust pan, plastic			#039809/\$4.13/ea	#640549/\$14.97/ea	\$6.16 ea

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
43b	Dust Pan	240 each	No Bid	Impact	Home Depot	Continental 712
	Dust Pan, impact resistant, plastic			#812879/\$3.52/ea	#418929/\$3.97/ea	\$1.25/MOR 12 ea
44	Compartment Tray	2400 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Genpak SN203VW
	Styrofoam 3 compartment					\$ 14.42/ cs
45	Compartment Plate	40 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Genpak 81300
	Styrofoam compartment plate					\$22.30/cs
46	Plastic Spoons	2400 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Network 406020
	Medium weight					\$ 7.17/cs
47a	Styrofoam Cup	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Dart 8J8
	8 ounce styrofoam cup					\$16.59/cs
47b	Styrofoam cup					
	16 ounce styrofoam cup	2 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Dart 16J16
						\$ 33.91/cs
48	Paper cup - 5 oz	400 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Solo R53
	5 ounce paper cup					\$85.71/cs
49a	Storage Bags	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Elkay F20305
	Zip style, 3' x 5"					5.01/cs
49b	Storage Bags	120 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Elkay F20508
	Zip style, 5" x 8"					\$12.15/cs

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		Graybar	Staples	Home Depot	Southeastern Paper Group Inc.
			Savannah, GA	Atlanta, GA	Atlanta, GA	Browns Summit, NC
49c	Storage Bags	160 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Elkay F20912
	Zip style, 9" x 12"					\$ 34.92/cs
50	Multi-fold towels	600 cases	No Bid	Brighton	No Bid	Network P25010
	9" x 9.5" 1-ply			#365374/\$17.19/4000 ct		\$ 14.03/cs
51	8" Roll towels	18 cases	No Bid	Brighton	No Bid	No bid
	white 8" x 630" x 9"			#365382/\$23.86/12 ct		
52	Brown Paper bags	120 bundles	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	AJM GS52NP5C
	1/6" - 50lb					\$ 26.82/bundle
53a	Toilet Tissue - 1 ply	2400 cases	No Bid	Heavenly Choice	No Bid	Atlas 115
	1-ply			#800794/\$34.35/96 ct		\$ 30.57/cs
53b	Toilet Tissue - 2 Ply	200 cases	No Bid	Brighton	No Bid	Atlas 276
	2-ply			#365377/\$35.16/96 ct		\$25.47/cs
54	Feminine Napkins	400 cases	No Bid	Naturelle	No Bid	Hospeco 147A
	Maxi Sanitary Napkins			#805890/\$31.60/250 ct		\$24.67/cs
55	Feminine Tampons	200 cases	No Bid	Naturelle	No Bid	Hospeco
	Tampax tampons			#812935/\$54.78/500 ct		\$52.55/cs
56a	Batteries	85 cases	\$.24/12240 ea	Duracell	No Bid	DRC PC1500BKD
	AA		\$2,940.00	#751595/\$83.20/144 ct		\$61.20/ per144
56b	Batteries	45 cases	\$.25/6840 ea	Duracell	No Bid	DRC PC2400BKD
	AAA		\$1,620.00	#751596/\$88.00/144 ct		\$63.00/ per 144

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
1a	Vinyl Gloves, Small VPP#81075(s)	150 cases	No Bid	VPP #81075 (s) \$ 46.55/cs	No Bid	No Bid
1b	Vinyl Gloves, Medium VPP#81075 (m)	300 cases	No Bid	VPP #81075 (m) \$46.55 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
1c	Vinyl Gloves, Large VPP#81075 (L)	600 cases	No Bid	VPP #81075 (l) \$46.55 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
1d	Vinyl Gloves, Xlarge VPP#81075 (XL)	800 cases	No Bid	VPP #81075 xl) \$46.55 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
2	Armbands, Photo Pinnacle Tech # DDSP10	5 cases	No Bid	No Bid	Pinnacle #ddsp10 \$850 / cs	No Bid
3	Flex Cluff	50 boxes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Earplugs	12 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Floor Finish Spartan #404655	48 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Finish and wax stripper Spartan #008455	48 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
7a	All purpose cleaner Spartan #003555	24 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7b	All purpose cleaner Spartan # 003515	72 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Abrasive cleanser Ajax or Comet	200 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Crème Cleanser Huskey CCA 430	144 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Liquid Bleach	50 cases	No Bid	SBC Bleach \$12.70 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
11	Laundry Detergent Spartan #702155	36 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Laundry Alkali Spartan #701655	36 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Liquid Enzymes	100 cases	No Bid	Nature's Solution #1800 \$28.92 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
14	Auto wash/wax	200 cases	No Bid	Betco Car/truck wash \$33.37 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
15	Graffiti Remover Spartan # 317103	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR AFP Industries South Miami, FL	VENDOR Coastal Paper-Sail Savannah, GA	VENDOR Pinnacle Technologies Greenville, SC	VENDOR Unipak, Corp Brooklyn, NY
	23-Aug-12					
16	Surface Disinfectant Cleaner Spartan # 320205	300 pails	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Surface Disinfectant Wipes Spartan # 108606	360 cases	No Bid	300 per cont/\$44.12/cs	No Bid	No Bid
18a	Surface Sanitizer Spartan # 315955	24 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18b	Surface Sanitizer Spartan # 315915	72 drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Hand Sanitizer Kutol Soap #68241	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Hand Sanitizing Wipes Nice Pak #P92084	360 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Antibacterial Hand Soap	360 cases	No Bid	Betco 7782900 \$36.44 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
22	Drain Treatment Spartan #309704	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Mold Control Spartan # 1204	120 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Odor Control Spartan #329704	72 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
25	Deodorizer/Sanitizer/Disinfectant Odoban #911101-G6	120 cases	No Bid	\$59.75 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
26	Deodorizing Air Fresheners Spartan #8010/14/18	12 master cs	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Windex Glass Cleaner Johnson	24 cases	No Bid	Johnson \$55.05 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
28	Hand Soap Cartridge Bay West #P95105	144 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	Disposable Rags Scott # 75260	12 cases	No Bid	Scott #75260 \$88.73 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
30a	Can Liners 38 x 60" can liner	1200 cases	No Bid	AWF #3860-17 \$23.74 / cs	No Bid	IBS S386017N \$23.90 / cs
30b	Can Liners 24" x 33" can liner	600 cases	No Bid	AWF #2433-5 \$15.39 / cs	No Bid	IBS EC2433N \$14.80 / cs
30c	Can Liners 38" x 58" can liner	100 cases	No Bid	AWF #3858 \$27.76 / cs	No Bid	PITT Plastic 385820 \$38 / cs
31	Handi-Pads 100% pure felted cotton, 4" x 4"	100 cases	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	Mop Head 24 oz cotton mop head	1200 cases	ABCO CM-20024 \$31.72/cs	#CL-14616 \$25.48 / cs	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
33	Mop Handle	600 each	No Bid	CL - 12642	No Bid	No Bid
	Crystal Lake #12642			\$4.99 / each		
34	Wringer/Bucket	100 each	Continental 33539YW	RCP#7590-88 yel	No Bid	No Bid
			\$ 52.54/ea	\$67.61 / each		
35	Wet Floor Sign	10 cases	No Bid	\$29.93 / cs	No Bid	No Bid
36	Scrubbing Pads	200 cases	Gilt 20941	Norton #000320	No Bid	No Bid
	6' x 9" green scrubbing pads		\$ 10.97/cs	\$14.97 / cs		
37a	Floor Polishing Pads - Natural	300 cases	No Bid	Norton #662610	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" polishing pad			19" - \$13.28 /cs		
				20" - \$13.53 / cs		
37b	Floor Polishing Pads - White	500 cases	Gilt 14420	Norton #	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" polishing pad		\$ 10.84/case	19" - \$13.28 / cs		
				20" - \$13.53 / cs		
37c	Floor Polishing Pads - Blue		No Bid	Norton	No Bid	No Bid
	27" Hi-performance polishing pad			\$30.87 /cs - 5 per case		
	PCS-TC27BI 27"					
38a	Floor Scrubbing - Red	100 cases	No Bid	Norton	No Bid	No Bid
	Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat			\$19.92 / cs		
	28" edge scrubber 14" x 28"					
	PCS-TC1428RD					

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
38b	Floor Scrubbing - Prep Pad	100 cases	No Bid	Norton	No Bid	No Bid
	Machine scrubbing pad for Tom Cat			\$37.82 / cs		
	28" edge scrubber 14" x 28"					
	PCS-TC1428PREP					
39	Floor Stripping Pads - Black	300 cases	Gilt 20014	Norton	No Bid	No Bid
	19"/20" stripping pad		\$ 10.84/cases	19" - \$13.28 / cs		
				20" - \$13.53 / cs		
40	Brush Handle - 60"	36 each	No Bid	CL-12839	No Bid	No Bid
	Wood construction handle			\$1.47 / each		
41a	Brush	96 each	No Bid	BB-140160	No Bid	No Bid
	Vehicle wash brush - 10" block			\$6.27 / each		
41b	Brush	432 each	No Bid	BB-230412	No Bid	No Bid
	Deck brush - 12" block			\$2.74 / each		
41c	Brush	432 each	No Bid	BB-310106	No Bid	No Bid
	6" iron shaped brush w/ 1 -1/2" - 2"			\$1.07 / each		
41d	Brush	432 each	No Bid	BB-280112	No Bid	No Bid
	Toliet bowl brush - plastic handle			\$1.17 / each		
42	Broom - large angle	20 cases	No Bid	BB-433012	No Bid	No Bid
				\$59.40 / cs		
43a	Dust Pan	36 each	No Bid	BB-410112	No Bid	No Bid
	Lobby style dust pan, plastic			\$6.11 / each		

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
43b	Dust Pan	240 each	No Bid	BB-41041z	No Bid	No Bid
	Dust Pan, impact resistant, plastic			\$1.70 / each		
44	Compartment Tray	2400 cases	No Bid	Dart 96HT3	No Bid	No Bid
	Styrofoam 3 compartment			\$16.11 / cs		
45	Compartment Plate	40 cases	No Bid	Dart 10cPWC	No Bid	No Bid
	Styrofoam compartment plate			\$23.02 / cs		
46	Plastic Spoons	2400 cases	No Bid	Gen PPTS	No Bid	No Bid
	Medium weight			\$23.02 / cs		
47a	Styrofoam Cup	200 cases	No Bid	Dart 8J8	No Bid	No Bid
	8 ounce styrofoam cup			\$16.57 / cs		
47b	Styrofoam cup	2 cases	No Bid	Dart 16J16	No Bid	No Bid
	16 ounce styrofoam cup			\$33.97 / cs		
48	Paper cup - 5 oz	400 cases	No Bid	Dix 58 ws	No Bid	No Bid
	5 ounce paper cup			\$41.31 / cs		
49a	Storage Bags	200 cases	No Bid	INTERPLAS	No Bid	No Bid
	Zip style, 3' x 5"			\$6.89 / cs		
49b	Storage Bags	120 cases	No Bid	INTERPLAS	No Bid	No Bid
	Zip style, 5" x 8"			\$15.05 / cs		

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
49c	Storage Bags	160 cases	No Bid	INTERPLAS	No Bid	No Bid
	Zip style, 9" x 12"			\$39.45 / cs		
50	Multi-fold towels	600 cases	No Bid	CPC-54002	No Bid	No Bid
	9" x 9.5" 1-ply			\$15.13 / cs		
51	8" Roll towels	18 cases	No Bid	CPC-79004	No Bid	No Bid
	white 8" x 630" x 9"			\$35.28 / cs		
52	Brown Paper bags	120 bundles	No Bid	sk1657	No Bid	No Bid
	1/6" - 50lb			\$32.77 / bdl		
53a	Toilet Tissue - 1 ply	2400 cases	No Bid	CPS-95017	No Bid	No Bid
	1-ply			\$31.17 / cs		
53b	Toilet Tissue - 2 Ply	200 cases	No Bid	GEN-201	No Bid	No Bid
	2-ply			\$29.60 / cs		
54	Feminine Napkins	400 cases	No Bid	HOS4-197	No Bid	No Bid
	Maxi Sanitary Napkins			\$35.16 / cs		
55	Feminie Tampons	200 cases	No Bid	HOS-Tampax	No Bid	No Bid
	Tampax tampons			\$58.14 / cs		
56a	Batteries	85 cases	No Bid	C-Procell-AA	No Bid	No Bid
	AA			\$55.50 / cs		
56b	Batteries	45 cases	No Bid	C-Procell - AAA	No Bid	No Bid
	AAA			\$57.67 / cs		

Bid Tab for 12-0028-3 Warehouse Supplies (3)

	ITEM	QTY/Brand	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR
	23-Aug-12		AFP Industries	Coastal Paper-Sail	Pinnacle Technologies	Unipak, Corp
			South Miami, FL	Savannah, GA	Greenville, SC	Brooklyn, NY
56c	Batteries	7 cases	No Bid	Duracell - AAAA	No Bid	No Bid
	AAAA			\$177.89 / cs		
56d	Batteries	4 cases	No Bid	C-Procell-C	No Bid	No Bid
	C			\$113.45 / cs		
56e	Batteries	14 cases	No Bid	C-Procell - D	No Bid	No Bid
	D			\$123.06 / cs		