

Bid Tab for 12-0074-3 Medical Items

		The Instrument House, Inc Suwanee, GA	Coastal Paper Sail Chemical Co. Savannah, GA	Henry Schein, Inc. Melville, NY	Tri-State Surgical Supply & Equipment LTD Brooklyn, NY	Prime Source Services, LLC Monsey, NY
9	Gurnery Bariatric Capacity Stryker EX-PRO R4 Transport Cot Or equal	3 ea No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6,235.42/\$18,706.26 As Specified	No Bid
10	Wheel Chair - Heavy Duty Invacare Tracer IV T4QS or equal	1 ea \$321.63 Brand: Invacare # T4X24RDA	No Bid	\$669.11 1102406	\$390.52 As Specified	\$415.00 Invacare Tracer IV
11	Wheel Chair - Normal Duty Invacare Tracer IV T4QS or equal	3 ea \$ 255.13/\$765.39 Invacare # T422RDA	No Bid	\$510.29/\$1,530.87 6783881	\$305.04/\$915.12 As Specified	\$ 265.00/\$795.00 Invacare Tracer IV
12	Weight Scale - Beam Type Detecto 437 Beam Medical Scale or equal	3 ea \$159.25/\$477.77	No Bid	\$293.29/\$879.87 5455496	\$229.36/\$688.08 Health-O-Meter/450KL	\$ 160.99/\$482.97 Detecto 437
13	Eye & Ear Scopes - Wall Mounted Beine EN100 Wall Transformer or equal	4 ea \$ 830.51/\$3,322.05 Welch Allyn # 77710-71M	No Bid	\$1,123.19/\$4,492.76 108-1830/A095-12-9807	\$781.40/\$3,125.60 As Specified	\$967.99/\$3,871.96 Heime A-095.12.976TL
14	Eye & Ear Scopes - Portable ADC Standard 2.5 V Diadnostic Set 5210 or equal	2 ea \$118.27/\$236.54	No Bid	\$127.61/\$255.22 720-4380/#5210	\$ 134.81/\$269.62 As Specified	\$ 148.00/\$296.00 ADC 5210
15	Sharps Container Wall Mounted and Gloves Dispenser Kendall Sharps Collector 8556H or equal	9 ea \$37.03/\$333.33	No Bid	\$101.99/\$917.91 666-3672/#8556H	\$ 36.60/\$329.40 As Specified	\$ 37.50/\$337.50 Kendall 8556H
	ITEM	QTY	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR

Bid Tab for 12-0074-3 Medical Items

			The Instrument House, Inc Suwanee, GA	Coastal Paper Sail Chemical Co. Savannah, GA	Henry Schein, Inc. Melville, NY	Tri-State Surgical Supply & Equipment LTD Brooklyn, NY	Prime Source Services, LLC Monsey, NY
16	Portable Exam Light on Mobile Stand Welch Allyn Series 300 or equal	4 ea	\$327.85/\$1,311.40	No Bid	\$461.69/\$1,846.76 114-2692/(GS300) #44400	\$431.79/\$1,727.16 As Specified	\$ 322.99/\$1,291.96 Welch Allyn 44410
17	EKG Machine with Cart Burdick Atria 3100 or equal	1 ea	\$3,548.67/\$3,548.67 Welch Allyn	No Bid	\$828.19 Burdick	\$3,860.87 Burdick	No Bid
18	Manual Exam Table Ritter 204 or equal	4 ea	\$ 1,246.91/4,987.65 Brewer #5000	No Bid	\$1,081.34/\$4,325.36 7025876	\$ 1,738.20/\$6,952.80 As Specified	\$ 1,424.98/\$5,699.92 Midmark 204/204-0001
19	Doctor Exam Stools Ritter 270 Economy or equal	6 ea	\$99.00/\$594.00	No Bid	\$108.26/\$649.56 1064121	\$362.44/\$2,174.64 As Specified	\$88.56/\$708.48 Drive 13034
20	Crash Card with AED Machine ZOLL AED Plus and PVC cart or equal	1 ea	\$1,685.00	No Bid	\$2,840.20 AED8667559/6800006	\$1,842.21 As Specified	No Bid
21	Plastic Wall Supply Units Med Storage ABD24 and 7466-1 or equal	9 ea	\$ 57.12/\$514.08	No Bid	No Bid	\$106.14/\$955.26 As Specified	No Bid
22	Portable Blood Pressure & Vital Signs Monitor	2 ea	\$ 2,649.36/\$5,298.72 Welch Allyn #45MTO-E1	No Bid	\$3,249.26/\$6498.52 324 8375	\$3,811.23/\$7,622.46 As Specified	\$3,260.93/\$6,521.86 CASMED 740
23	Trash Cans with Lids Rubber main 29568	10 ea	\$ 26.42/\$264.29	\$20.49/\$204.90 Rubbermaid 2956	\$ 180.32/\$1,803.20 1183410	\$68.32/\$683.20 As Specified	No Bid
	ITEM	QTY	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR	VENDOR

Bid Tab for 12-0074-3 Medical Items

			The Instrument House, Inc Suwanee, GA	Coastal Paper Sail Chemical Co. Savannah, GA	Henry Schein, Inc. Melville, NY	Tri-State Surgical Supply & Equipment LTD Brooklyn, NY	Prime Source Services, LLC Monsey, NY
24	Back Board with Straps BASE backboard or equal	10 ea	\$145.64/\$1,456.41	No Bid	\$2,160.60 6727539/3876808	\$386.50/\$3,865.00 Pro-Eco Spineboard	No bid
25	Bariatric Power Lift Drive Medical Model No. 13244 or equal	1 ea	\$1,739.81	No Bid	\$2,472.11 1179076	\$1,651.50 As Specified	\$1,599.00 Drive Medical 13244
Total			\$45,422.24	\$2,844.40	\$54,402.82	\$77,233.97	\$40,159.69